FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\(Cliemts\Stted g \Wastvika\aairt s thitid tetemRRD S Con Dasls \G GO0t g ATST/SAALE BB PRbistnen &) Oalcdd SASAPEDATATE/ 2915028 2358 78\P M BLOTDE B/ 751529 2304:00PM

M:Iwille

Your Hometown Car Wash

WASHVILLE - WAS04-078

CARWASH

991-995 WEST MAIN ROAD
MIDDLETOWN, Rl 02842

NEWPORT COUNTY

995 W MainRd,
idd|etown; Rl 02842

Middietown

Coasters |,
Harbor Island

NEWPORT EAST

LOCATION MAP

g RO

apgespered

o

Sanayigy
Point-Beach

o Blddim,

Newport National
Golf Club:

oy BUDHOM.

L
I, i

wops™

Groen End Ave

B %,
B

Norman Bird
Sanctuary

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

NEW TUNNEL CAR WASH WITH ASSOCIATED PARKING AND AMENITIES.

SITE NOTES

1.

THE BOUNDARY LINES AND TOPOGRAPHY FOR THIS PROJECT ARE BASED ON A FIELD
SURVEY COMPLETED BY GPI DATED: 03.03.2022.

PARCEL INFORMATION:

PARCEL NUMBER: 106-115 AND 106-116
OWNER: WASHVILLE
. -t +
ACRES: DEVELOPMENT: LOT 115 = +19,904 S.F. (£ 0.45 ACRES)

LOT 116 = +19,044 S.F. (+0.43 ACRES)

BUILDING CODE REVIEW

ACCESSIBILITY CODE

ANSI/ICC A117.1 - 2009

BUILDING CODE

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 2015 (IBC 2015)

ELECTRICAL CODE

RHODE ISLAND ELECTRICAL CODE WITH NFPA 70, 2017

ENERGY CODE

INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE 2015 (IECC 2015)

MECHANICAL CODE

INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 2015 (IMC 2015)

PLUMBING CODE

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE (IPC 2015)

FIRE CODE RHODE ISLAND FIRE CODE WITH NFPA 1, 2018

ZONING ORDINANCE REVIEW

ZONING ORDINANCE

THE TOWN OF MIDDLETOWN RI, ZONING CODE. ADOPTED: 10.30.2006

ZONING MAP

TOWN OF MIDDLETOWN ZONING, PARCELS, & STREETS 2022.
ADOPTED 01.05.2022

SITE ZONING

GBA: GENERAL BUSINESS (TRAFFIC SENSITIVE)

PERMITTED USE

YES, SECTION 602 CHART (BUSINESS SERVICES)

SCALE: NTS

Limited & Office Business

ZONING - APN MAP

BULK REGULATIONS
ITEM REQUIRED PROPOSED ORDINANCE
LOT REQUIREMENTS:
MIN. LOT AREA 12,000 S.F. 38,948 S F.
MIN. LOT FRONTAGE 100'-0" 199.8' SECTION 603
MAX. LOT COVERAGE 20% 11% DISTRICT
' ° ° DIMENSIONAL
BUILDING REQUIREMENTS: REGULATIONS
MAX. BUILDING HEIGHT 40'-0"
MAX. FOOTPRINT 35,000 S.F. 4,289 S F. SECTION 605
SETBACK REQUIREMENTS:
FRONT BUILDING SETBACK 10.0' 87.3' SECTION 603
TLTREST DISTRICT
SIDE BUILDING SETBACK 10.0' 2P DIMENSIONAL
SOUTH: 20.9 REGULATIONS
REAR BUILDING SETBACK 20.0' 67.3'
PARKING REQUIREMENTS:
MIN. STANDARD SPACE SIZE 9'x 18’ 9'x 18’
1 SPACE PER 1,000 SECTION 1304
GS.F. 4 STANDARD SPACES
PARKING CALCULATION 42895.F/1,000=5 | 15VACUUM SPACES
SPACES
BARRIER-FREE SPACES 1 PER 25 SPACES 2 ANSI/ICC A117.1

Medium Density Residential

PROJECT DIRECTORY

sevan

DESCRIPTION ADDRESS CONTACT
GR MIDDLETOWN LAND LLC
OWNER/ | 164 MASON STREET, SUITE 201 JAMES CANNING
" onoiEcr | SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS SRADY CARLUCC
= A ohe | 37704 HILLS TECH DRIVE o paivn
FARMINGTON HILLS, MI 48331 .236.
GPI
SURVEYOR | 325 WEST MAIN STREET 631.587.5060
BABYLON, NY 11702
SEVAN ENGINEERING, PC
CIVIL ENGINEER | 37704 HILLS TECH DRIVE ;%‘;XTE&ATZ PE
z 5 FARMINGTON HILLS, M 48331 841,
S E
8= SEVAN DESIGN SOLUTIONS, P.C.
© ARCHITECT | 3025 HIGHLAND PARKWAY SUITE #850 | -
DOWNERS GROVE, IL 60515
ELECTRIC | - -
GAS - -
ol
5 WATER - -
'_
)
SANITARY SEWER | - -
STORM SEWER | -- -
PLANNING | TOWN OF MIDDLETOWN RONALD M. WOLANSKI, AICP
DIRECTOR OF PLANNING AND
DEPARTMENT | 350 EAST MAIN ROAD e oAt
_ (TOWNSHIP) | MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842 PR pTen
=
o ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT WARREN HALL
=z ENGINEER | 9 BERKELEY AVE. TOWN ENGINEER
= MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842 401.846.2119
()
SULDING | TOWN OF MIDDLETOWN CHRIS COSTA
DEoarTaear | 350 EAST MAIN ROAD BUILDING OFFICIAL
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842 401.847.5769

Tighs & Bond

i
N

SCALE: NTS

SHEET INDEX ENGINEERING
5
A =
= s £ 25
= o o |9z bt
<t o o 8 % T
= E '5 E § § 8 = g . Corporate Office: )
o o o o O O |qWw " 3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
= o o o = = o > [
g o o o o o CL o Downers Grove, IL 60515
~N = ~N a ~N ~N ~N ~ O ~ — ﬁ ~N O info@sevansolutions.com www.sevansolutions.com
LRI |Qe |Re |Re |fe |Ee [RZTE|Ro
o |oh |veh |BbHL | |« eS| < o INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY
Jw ™S oS | (S (NS |oWam (oS
o = O W o0 o0 o W — NS D
O un O o= O o= O o= O o= — o —A = un| O o
REVISIONS
GENERAL 0 1 2 3 4 5 J6-11 1 12 13 NO.| DATE |DESCRIPTION
G0.01 COVER SHEET ° ° ° ° ° ° 0 [03.19.2022|SITE PLAN REVIEW
50.02 GENERAL NOTES 1 ]06.30.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT
2 [08.05.2022|REVISED PER RIDOT
SURVEY 3 [08.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM
10F1 EXISTING CONDITIONS PLAN ° o ° ° ° ° ° 4 [09.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
L 5 [11.21.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
6 [12.08.2022|REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE
C1.11 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL PLAN ° ° ° ° ° ° ° 8 [01.09.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
€1.20 DIMENSION CONTROL SITE PLAN °® ° ° ° ° ° o 9 [01.23. 2023 REVISED PER EASEMENT
10 {02.01.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
C1.30 GRADING PLAN ® ® ® ® ® ® ® 11 [02.06.2023[REVISED PER EASEMENT
C1.31 STORM WATER MANAGEMENT PLAN °® ° ° ° ° ° ° 12 02.14.2023|REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT
C1.32 SAND FILTER AND CDS DETAILS ° ° ° ° ° o
C1.40 UTILITY PLAN ° ° ° ° ° ° o
C5.00 FROSION CONTROL DETAILS ° ° ° ° ° ° °
C5.01 SITE DETAILS °® ° ° ° ° ° o
C5.02 SITE DETAILS ° ° ° ° ° ° °
C5.03 UTILITY DETAILS [ ) [ ) [ ) o o o o CONSULTANT
C6.10 MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC PLAN ° ° ° ° °
ALL WORK TO BE DONE WITHIN THE STATE HIGHWAY RIGHT OF WAY (ROW)
SHALL CONFORM TO THE RHODE ISLAND STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS FOR ROAD
AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION, 2004 EDITION (AMENDED MARCH 2018) WITH ALL
REVISIONS AND ADDENDA. STANDARD DETAILS FOR THIS WORK ARE R.l.
STANDARD DETAILS 1998 EDITION (AMENDED JUNE 2019) WITH ALL REVISIONS -
ALL TRAFFIC CONTROL SHALL CONFORM TO THE MANUAL ON UNIFORM TRAFFIC
CONTROL DEVICES (MUTCD), 2009 EDITION, INCLUDING ALL REVISIONS TIMOTHY KRATZ

\ /
02/15/2023 \/

CUSTOMER

——

ashoille

Your Hometown Car Wash

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

WASHVILLE CARWASH

PROJECT LOCATION

991-995 W MAIN RD
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842

(NEWPORT COUNTY)

SHEET TITLE

COVER SHEET

SHEET MANAGEMENT

PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN Rl

DATE:

CRITERIA: 110" TUNNEL

PROJECT MANAGER:

THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.

REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN|
PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.

(NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022

SHEET NUMBER

G0.01




FILE NAME: Y-\Sharred\Cliemts\Stem by \WeathvilaMAzirs s tMtdth etomRR D 6oB Bexs\G GOD 2 g ATTSSSAVE BB P -Raistran ) Dslcid 6 ASEDEDATATE/ 318J202256.56,P R OTOADED T5/15) 20 2302:60PM

1.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

26.

27.

28.

29.

GENERAL NOTES:

[TIS THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR TO KNOW ALL OBSERVABLE CONDITIONS
AND TO CONFORM TO ALL APPLICABLE CODES. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL INFORM THE
OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE OF ANY NECESSARY OR APPROPRIATE QUESTIONS OR CLARIFICATIONS.
THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL INCORPORATE ALL APPLICABLE FEDERAL, STATE, AND LOCAL
CODES AND STANDARDS, INCLUDING FEDERAL ADA REQUIREMENTS.

THE DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL (INCLUDING ASSOCIATED STUDIES, DRAWINGS, SHOP
DRAWINGS AND SIMILAR INSTRUMENTS AS APPLICABLE) CONSTITUTE THE GUIDELINES FOR THE
PROJECT AND SHALL BE USED IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE AFOREMENTIONED ENTIRE BODY OF
PROJECT INFORMATION. IT IS THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR TO PROVIDE
COMPLETE INFORMATION TO ALL JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITIES, SUBCONTRACTORS, ALLIED
CONSULTANTS, HIRES, AND ASSIGNS.

ALL CONSTRUCTION SHALL COMPLY WITH THE DRAWINGS, PROJECT MANUAL, CODES AND
STANDARDS OF THE JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY OR AUTHORITIES. ALL CONSTRUCTION SHALL BE
PERFORMED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE OSHA, FEDERAL, STATE AND LOCAL
REGULATIONS. IN CASE OF DISCREPANCIES, THE MORE STRINGENT REQUIREMENT SHALL APPLY.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR PERFORMING THE WORK SHALL MAINTAIN A GENERAL "A" LICENSE
WITH HAZ MAT CERTIFICATION FROM THE CONTRACTOR'S STATE LICENSE BOARD AND/OR OTHER
JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL IMMEDIATELY NOTIFY THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE OF ANY
DISCREPANCIES FOUND DURING THE INVESTIGATION OF EXISTING UTILITIES AND TOPOGRAPHY
AND/OR DURING THE CONSTRUCTION PHASE.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR ALL PERMITS, PERMIT FEES, LICENSES AND
LICENSE FEES. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL OBTAIN ALL NECESSARY CONSTRUCTION
PERMITS REQUIRED TO PERFORM ALL REQUIRED WORK. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL POST ALL
BONDS, PAY ALL FEES, PROVIDE PROOF OF INSURANCE AND PROVIDE ALL TRAFFIC CONTROL
NECESSARY FOR THIS WORK.

WORK SHALL CONFORM TO THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE GOVERNING AGENCY OR AGENCIES
HAVING JURISDICTION. GRADING, PAVING, AND MATERIALS SHALL COMPLY WITH THE
JURISDICTIONAL ROADWAY AUTHORITY OR AUTHORITIES (E.G., DEPARTMENT OF
TRANSPORTATION) STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS FOR CONSTRUCTION AS WELL AS PROJECT
SPECIFICATIONS AND DRAWINGS. IN CASE OF DISCREPANCIES BETWEEN REQUIREMENTS, ATTAIN
CLARIFICATION FROM THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL ENSURE ALL SITE INSPECTIONS REQUIRED BY CITY AND/OR
STATE AGENCIES, AND/OR OTHER JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY ARE TO BE SCHEDULED A MINIMUM
OF FIVE WORKING DAYS IN ADVANCE OF REQUESTED INSPECTION DATE.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL VERIFY ALL SITE CONDITIONS IN THE FIELD AND CONTACT THE
OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE IF THERE ARE ANY QUESTIONS OR CONFLICTS REGARDING THE
DRAWINGS, PROJECT MANUAL AND/OR FIELD CONDITIONS SO THAT APPROPRIATE ADJUSTMENTS
AND/OR REVISIONS CAN BE MADE PRIOR TO CONSTRUCTION. ANY CONFLICTS BETWEEN THE
DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL SHALL BE IDENTIFIED BY THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR AND
CONFIRMED WITH THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE PRIOR TO BIDDING.

MATERIAL TESTING SHALL BE SUPPLIED BY THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE. THE GENERAL
CONTRACTOR SHALL COORDINATE WITH TESTING FIRM. ALL RE-TESTING IS THE RESPONSIBILITY OF
THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR.

SOIL SAMPLES MAY BE REQUIRED TO BE TAKEN FOR TESTING AT THE DIRECTION OF HAZ MAT,
OTHER JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY, OR THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL MAINTAIN A CLEAN WORK AREA. TRASH AND WASTE
MATERIALS SHALL BE COLLECTED AT A SAFE POINT, AWAY FROM FLAMES OR OTHER FIRE SOURCES.
THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL PREVENT ANY LEAKS OR DRIPS OF HYDRAULIC FLUID, MOTOR
OIL, MOTOR FUELS, SOLVENTS, AND OTHER HYDROCARBONS FROM CONTAMINATING THE
GROUND. SUCH SPILLS SHALL BE IMMEDIATELY COVERED WITH AN OIL ABSORBING MEDIUM (E.G.
“OIL DRY”) AND REMOVED FROM THE SITE IN A LEGAL AND ENVIRONMENTALLY SOUND MANNER.
TRASH SHALL BE PROPERLY DISPOSED OF DAILY, UNLESS A COVERED DUMPSTER IS PROVIDED AND
ITS LOCATION APPROVED BY THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR THE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL OF ALL RUBBISH,
TRASH, DEBRIS AND ORGANIC MATERIAL IN A LAWFUL MANNER.

PROVIDE ADEQUATE BARRICADES AT DRIVES, ENTRANCES, EXCAVATIONS, OTHER OPENINGS, AND
HAZARDOUS AREAS TO KEEP OUT UNAUTHORIZED PERSONS, FOR PUBLIC SAFETY, AND TRAFFIC
CONTROL. SAFETY PROVISIONS OF APPLICABLE LAWS SHALL BE OBSERVED AT ALL TIMES.
BARRICADES LEFT IN PLACE AT NIGHT SHALL BE LIGHTED.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR SHORING AND FOR DEWATERING TO
ACCOMPLISH ALL WORK INDICATED ON PLANS AND TO PERFORM REQUIRED COMPACTION
OPERATIONS. DEWATERING SHALL NOT DISCHARGE TO ANY SANITARY SEWER SYSTEM OR BE
PUMPED ONTO ANY PUBLIC ROADWAY.

PROMPTLY REMOVE ALL DEMOLITIONS, PROJECT DISCARDS, RUBBISH, AND DEBRIS FROM THE
LIMITS OF THE OWNER'S PROPERTY AND/OR EFFECTIVE PROJECT LIMITS, AND DISPOSE IN A LEGAL
MANNER.

ALL EQUIPMENT TO BE INSTALLED SHALL BE UL APPROVED.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE A TRAFFIC SEQUENCING AND SCHEDULING PLAN AT
THE ON-SITE PRE-CONSTRUCTION MEETING WITH THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVES AND
APPLICABLE LANDLORD'S REPRESENTATIVE(S).

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR'S MANNER AND METHOD OF INGRESS AND EGRESS WITH RESPECT TO
THE PROJECT AREA SHALL IN NO WAY PROHIBIT OR DISTURB NORMAL PEDESTRIAN OR VEHICULAR
TRAFFIC IN THE VICINITY AND IS SUBJECT TO REGULATION AND WRITTEN APPROVAL OF AFFECTED
OWNER(S), JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY, AND/OR AUTHORITIES, AS APPLICABLE.

ALL CONSTRUCTION SHALL BE CONDUCTED TO CAUSE MINIMAL INTERFERENCE WITH STREETS,
DRIVES OR WALKS. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC
AND SHALL NOT CAUSE THE CLOSURE OR OBSTRUCTION OF STREETS, DRIVES, WALKS OR USER
FACILITIES WITHOUT PERMISSION FROM THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL PHASE CONSTRUCTION IN SUCH A WAY AS TO MAINTAIN AN
ACCESS ROUTE FROM AN ENTRANCE DRIVE TO TRUCK DOCKS AND/OR LOADING AREA(S) AT ALL
TIMES.

CONTRACTOR SHALL KEEP EXISTING STREETS, ROADS AND DRIVES CLEAR OF DIRT, DEBRIS AND
EQUIPMENT.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL OBTAIN APPROVAL FROM THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE FOR
PARKING AND STORAGE OF EQUIPMENT. THIS AREA, AS WELL AS THE JOB SITE, SHALL BE ENCLOSED
IN CHAIN LINK FENCING. A TRAFFIC LANE SHALL BE DESIGNATED FOR INGRESS AND EGRESS FROM
THE WORK AREA. IF REQUIRED, FLAG MEN SHALL BE PROVIDED TO PROVIDE FOR SAFE AND
EFFICIENT MOVEMENT OF VEHICLES. NO CHANGES TO THE WORK AREA OR TO THE AGREED
TRAFFIC PATTERN SHALL BE MADE WITHOUT PRIOR APPROVAL OF THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE;
THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE WILL SECURE APPROVAL FOR SUCH CHANGES, IF APPLICABLE.

NO EQUIPMENT OR MATERIAL STORAGE IS PERMITTED WITHIN THE ROAD RIGHT-OF-WAY.

FOR THE DURATION OF CONSTRUCTION OPERATIONS, EMPLOYEE(S) WILL PARK IN A LOCATION
DESIGNATED BY THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE.

RESTORE ALL STREET SURFACES, DRIVEWAYS, CULVERTS, ROADSIDE DRAINAGE DITCHES, AND
OTHER PUBLIC OR PRIVATE STRUCTURES THAT ARE DISTURBED OR DAMAGED AS A RESULT ON
CONSTRUCTION ACTIVITIES TO A CONDITION EQUAL TO OR BETTER THAN EXISTING CONDITIONS
AND TO THE SATISFACTION OF AFFECTED OWNER(S), JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY, AND/OR
AUTHORITIES, AS APPLICABLE.

PROTECT EXISTING TREES TO REMAIN WITH TEMPORARY FENCING PLACED AT THE DRIP LINE. NO
GROUND DISTURBANCE OR STORAGE OF MATERIAL SHALL OCCUR WITHIN THE DRIP LINE LIMITS,
UNLESS HEREON EXPRESSLY INDICATED OTHERWISE.

WRITTEN DIMENSIONS SHALL PREVAIL. NO DIMENSION MAY BE SCALED. REFER ANY UNCLEAR
ITEMS TO THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE FOR INTERPRETATION.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR VERIFYING ALL PROPOSED DIMENSIONS
FOR BUILDINGS, WALLS, CONCRETE SLABS, UTILITY SERVICE POINT CONNECTIONS, ETC., AND
SHALL NOTIFY THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE OF ANY CONFLICTS OR DISCREPANCIES PRIOR TO
CONSTRUCTION.

30.

31

32.

33.

34.

35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

40.

41.

42.

43.

44.

45,

46.

47.

48.

49.

50.

51.

52.

53.

54.

55.

56.

57.

COORDINATES AND/OR DIMENSIONS SHOWN ON THESE DRAWINGS ARE TO FACE OF CURB,
OUTSIDE FACE OF BUILDING FOUNDATIONS, EDGE OF PAVEMENT, OR CENTER OF STRUCTURE OR
SIGN UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE.

ANY BEARINGS USED HEREON ARE FOR THE PURPOSE OF ANGULAR MEASUREMENT ONLY AND ARE
NOT NECESSARILY REFERENCED TO TRUE OR MAGNETIC NORTH.

UNDERGROUND UTILITIES MUST BE MARKED, AS REQUIRED BY PUBLIC ACT 53 OF 1974.
TELEPHONE THE REGIONAL UTILITY LOCATOR/ONE-CALL SYSTEM OFFICE BEFORE ANY DIGGING.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR AT ALL TIMES SHALL ABIDE BY ALL OSHA, FEDERAL, STATE AND LOCAL
REGULATIONS WHEN OPERATING CRANES, BOOMS, HOISTS, ETC. IN CLOSE PROXIMITY TO
OVERHEAD LINES. IF THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR MUST OPERATE EQUIPMENT CLOSE TO
UNDERGROUND AND/OR OVERHEAD ELECTRIC LINES, CONTACT THE AFFECTED UTILITY COMPANY
AND MAKE ARRANGEMENTS FOR PROPER SAFEGUARDS, PRIOR TO OPERATION.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL, AT HIS OR HER EXPENSE, RESTORE ANY AND ALL STRUCTURES,
PIPE, UTILITY, PAVEMENT, CURB, SIDEWALK, LANDSCAPED AREA, ETC. DISTURBED WITHIN THE SITE
AND/OR ADJOINING PROPERTIES DURING DEMOLITION OR CONSTRUCTION. SUCH FACILITIES
SHALL BE RESTORED TO THEIR ORIGINAL CONDITION OR BETTER, TO THE SATISFACTION OF THE
AFFECTED OWNER(S).

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR CONFIRMING THE HORIZONTAL AND VERTICAL
LOCATION OF ALL EXISTING UTILITIES PRIOR TO ANY CONSTRUCTION.

IN ALL CASES THE LOCATION OF EXISTING UTILITIES SHOWN ON THESE PLANS IS ASSUMED TO BE
APPROXIMATE. LOCATIONS ARE BASED ON THE BEST AVAILABLE REFERENCE PLANS AND AN
ACTUAL FIELD SURVEY OF VISIBLE STRUCTURES. CONTACT THE REGIONAL UTILITY
LOCATOR/ONE-CALL SYSTEM OFFICE BEFORE DIGGING.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL NOT INTERRUPT EXISTING UTILITIES AND/OR SERVICING
FACILITIES OCCUPIED AND USED BY THE OWNER, LANDLORD, OR OTHERS DURING OCCUPIED
HOURS EXCEPT WHEN SUCH INTERRUPTIONS HAVE BEEN AUTHORIZED IN WRITING BY THE
AFFECTED OWNER, LANDLORD, JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY, AND/OR UTILITY COMPANY.
INTERRUPTIONS SHALL OCCUR ONLY AFTER ACCEPTABLE TEMPORARY OR PERMANENT SERVICE
HAS BEEN PROVIDED.

NOT USED.

THE CONTRACTOR SHALL MAINTAIN, AT THE JOB SITE, A COMPLETE SET OF CONSTRUCTION
DOCUMENTS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND MAKE THEM AVAILABLE TO THE OWNER'S
REPRESENTATIVE, SUBCONTRACTORS, AND/OR ALLIED CONSULTANTS THROUGHOUT THE
CONSTRUCTION PROCESS.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR THE TIMELY COMPLETION OF ALL PHASES OF
CONSTRUCTION. CONSTRUCTION PROJECT TO BE COMPLETED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ALL
DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL, AND TURNED OVER TO THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE IN
FULLY OPERATIONAL CONDITION.

UPON COMPLETION OF THE WORK, THERE SHALL BE A FINAL INSPECTION OF THE PROJECT BY THE
OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE. ALL EQUIPMENT SHALL BE TESTED UNDER NORMAL OPERATING
CONDITIONS. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL HAVE AN ELECTRICIAN AVAILABLE DURING THE
OPENING TO IMPLEMENT ANY APPROPRIATE OR REQUIRED ADJUSTMENTS TO THE EQUIPMENT.

AFTER ALL WORK HAS BEEN COMPLETED AND THE PROJECT HAS BEEN TESTED AND ACCEPTED, THE
GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL SWEEP THE ENTIRE WORK AREA CLEAN AND REMOVE ALL DIRT,
MUD, TRASH, WASTE MATERIAL, CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT, AND VEHICLES. DAMAGED PARKING
STRIPES OR STAINED PAVEMENT SHALL BE REFINISHED TO ITS ORIGINAL CONDITION BY THE
GENERAL CONTRACTOR.

SPECIAL CARE SHALL BE TAKEN DURING ALL TRENCHING OPERATIONS. SHEETING AND BRACING,
CRIBBING, ETC. MUST BE INSTALLED AS NECESSARY OR APPROPRIATE TO PROVIDE MAXIMUM
SAFETY TO THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR'S WORKERS, AND SHALL BE IN FULL COMPLIANCE WITH
OSHA REGULATIONS.

SAWCUT AND REMOVE EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT AS NEEDED TO INSTALL NEW CONCRETE
CURBING, WALKS, UNDERGROUND UTILITIES AND/OR NEW BUILDING(S) OR STRUCTURE(S).
SAWCUTS SHALL BE MADE A MINIMUM OF 1' BEYOND THE ACTUAL NEW CURB OR WALK LIMITS.

REMOVE AND REPLACE EXISTING PAVEMENT AS NEEDED TO MATCH EXISTING AND PROPOSED
GRADES.

PRIOR TO PROCEEDING FURTHER WITH THE AFFECTED WORK, THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL
NOTIFY THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE OF ANY DISCREPANCY REGARDING THE PROPOSED WORK
OR UNFORESEEN CONDITIONS.

ALL PAVEMENTS, ASSOCIATED AGGREGATE MATERIALS AND WORK COMPLETED SHALL BE IN
STRICT ACCORDANCE WITH THE STATE DOT OR OTHER JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY
SPECIFICATIONS AND STANDARD DETAILS UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY SPECIFIED IN THE
DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL.

PIPE BOLLARDS SHALL BE INSTALLED IN TRAFFIC AND LOADING AREAS AS REQUIRED TO PROTECT
BUILDING CORNERS, RECEIVING AREAS, HYDRANTS, TRANSFORMERS, METERS, GENERATORS,
COMPACTORS, STEPS AND RAILINGS AS NECESSARY.

WHENEVER REQUIRED OR APPROPRIATE, THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL SUBMIT SHOP
DRAWINGS OF ALL PRODUCTS AND MATERIALS TO THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE, ENGINEER AND
JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY OR AUTHORITIES, AND SHALL ACQUIRE SHOP DRAWING APPROVAL
PRIOR TO FABRICATION AND/OR DELIVERY TO THE SITE. ALLOW A MINIMUM OF 14 WORKING DAYS
FOR REVIEW AND APPROVAL.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL REFERENCE ARCHITECTURAL PLANS FOR EXACT DIMENSIONS
AND CONSTRUCTION DETAILS OF BUILDING(S), ROOF DRAINS, RAISED CONCRETE SIDEWALKS,
RAMPS, STAIRWAYS, ETC.

TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS SHALL CONFORM TO THE STATE DOT AND/OR
OTHER JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY STANDARDS, AND TO THE MOST CURRENT “MANUAL ON
UNIFORM TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES”.

FIRE LANES SHALL BE ESTABLISHED AND PROPERLY DESIGNATED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE LOCAL MUNICIPALITY, FIRE DEPARTMENT AND OTHER
JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY REQUIREMENTS.

IF APPLICABLE, THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL REMOVE ON-SITE
CONFLICTING PAVEMENT MARKINGS IN A METHOD APPROVED BY THE OWNER'S
REPRESENTATIVE, STATE DOT AND OTHER JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY. THE
GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL EXERCISE CARE TO AVOID INSTALLATION OF
CONFLICTING SIGNS AND MARKINGS.

AGGREGATE AND BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION
SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE DOT AND/OR OTHER JURISDICTIONAL
AUTHORITY STANDARDS. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL SUBMIT AGGREGATE
SIEVE ANALYSES AND JOB-MIX FORMULAS FOR AGGREGATE AND BITUMINOUS
PAVEMENT TO THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE FOR REVIEW AND APPROVAL AT
LEAST 14 DAYS PRIOR TO PAVEMENT INSTALLATION.

ALTERNATIVE METHODS AND PRODUCTS OTHER THAN THOSE SPECIFIED IN THE DRAWINGS AND
PROJECT MANUAL MAY BE USED IF REVIEWED AND APPROVED BY

THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE AND OTHER AFFECTED JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY

PRIOR TO INSTALLATION.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR OBTAINING ALL NECESSARY CONSTRUCTION
PLANS, SHOP DRAWINGS, LAYOUTS AND SURVEY INFORMATION, AND

FOR EXECUTING ALL SURVEY FIELD WORK REQUIRED, TO PERFORM CONSTRUCTION

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL.

THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE RESERVES THE RIGHT TO MODIFY THE DETAILS

AND STANDARDS OF CONSTRUCTION FOR ALL PRIVATE FACILITIES FROM THOSE INDICATED IN THE
DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL, PROVIDED THAT ANY ALTERNATE STANDARD COMPLIES WITH
ALLJURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY REQUIREMENTS, AND THAT THE GENERAL DESIGN INTENT OF THE
PROJECT ISNOT COMPROMISED.

DEMOLITION NOTES: BID NOTES:
1. SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL MEASURES MUST BE IN PLACE PRIOR TO ANY SITE 1. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL VISIT THE SITE BEFORE BIDDING.
DEMOLITION, EXCAVATION OR GRADING.
2. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR CALCULATING ALL QUANTITIES.
2. PERFORM CLEARING, STRUCTURE REMOVAL, PAVEMENT REMOVAL AND APPLICABLE STOCKPILING
IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PROJECT DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL. THE GENERAL 3. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL INCLUDE THE BITUMINOUS AND CONCRETE PAVING SHOWN ON THE PLANS

1.

2.

10.

11.

12.

CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR THE LAWFUL REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL OF ALL RUBBISH, TRASH,
DEBRIS, ORGANIC MATERIAL, ETC. SEE GENERAL NOTES #13.

. NO ATTEMPT IS MADE TO STIPULATE EACH ITEM TO BE REMOVED AND/OR DEMOLISHED, EITHER

ON THE DRAWINGS OR IN THE PROJECT MANUAL. THE CONTRACTOR MUST VISIT THE SITE TO
ASSESS EXISTING PHYSICAL CONDITIONS, AS WELL AS REVIEW THE DRAWINGS, AND ULTIMATELY
DETERMINE WORK NECESSARY TO ACCOMPLISH INTENDED RESULTS DESCRIBED BY THE PROJECT
DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL.

. COMPLETELY RESTORE ALL DISTURBED AREAS TO CONDITION EQUAL TO OR BETTER THAN EXISTING

CONDITION AND TO THE SATISFACTION OF AFFECTED OWNER(S) AND/OR GOVERNING AUTHORITY.
ALL COSTS FOR CLEAN-UP, RESTORATION WORK AND OTHER RESTORATION OPERATIONS SUCH AS,
BUT NOT LIMITED TO, CONSTRUCTION SIGNAGE, STREET SWEEPING AND MAINTAINING EXISTING
UTILITIES SHALL BE THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR'S RESPONSIBILITY. RESTORATION WORK SHALL BE
PERFORMED WITHIN FIVE (5) WORKING DAYS AFTER COMPLETION OF FINAL GRADING.

. WHERE EXISTING PAVEMENT IS TO BE PARTIALLY REMOVED, SAWCUT PAVEMENT TO FULL DEPTH

TO PROVIDE A SMOOTH JOINT WITH PROPOSED PAVEMENT.

. ALL DEMOLITION WORK SHALL CONFORM TO THE STANDARDS AND SPECIFICATIONS OF THE

JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY.

. IF APPROPRIATE, RETAIN SOIL SPOILS FROM CONSTRUCTION EXCAVATION AND STORE AT

DESIGNATED LOCATION FOR RE-USE, IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE GEOTECHNICAL REPORT, PROJECT
DRAWINGS, AND OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE APPROVAL(S).

UTILITY NOTES:

PROTECT AND MAINTAIN CROSSINGS WITH ANY AND ALL OTHER UTILITY LINES.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR CONTACTING THE JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY
OR AUTHORITIES TO PROVIDE FEES AND SECURE PERMITS FOR STREET CUTS AND CONNECTIONS
TO EXISTING UTILITIES.

THOROUGH COORDINATION WITH THE RESPECTIVE UTILITY COMPANIES SHALL BE PERFORMED
BY THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR TO INSURE THAT ALL UTILITY COMPANY, AND OTHER
JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY STANDARDS FOR MATERIALS AND CONSTRUCTION METHODS ARE
MET.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS SOLELY RESPONSIBLE FOR DETERMINING ACTUAL LOCATIONS AND
ELEVATIONS OF ALL UTILITIES, INCLUDING SERVICES AND SERVICE LINES, PRIOR TO
CONSTRUCTION.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL VISIT THE SITE AND VERIFY THE ELEVATION AND LOCATION OF
ALL UTILITIES BY VARIOUS MEANS PRIOR TO BEGINNING ANY EXCAVATION. TEST PITS SHALL BE
DUG AT ALL LOCATIONS WHERE SEWERS CROSS EXISTING UTILITIES AND THE HORIZONTAL AND
VERTICAL LOCATIONS OF THE UTILITIES SHALL BE DETERMINED. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR
SHALL CONTACT THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE IN THE EVENT OF ANY UNFORESEEN CONFLICTS
BETWEEN EXISTING AND PROPOSED UTILITIES SO THAT AN APPROPRIATE MODIFICATION MAY BE
MADE.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL ARRANGE FOR AND COORDINATE WITH THE RESPECTIVE
UTILITY COMPANIES FOR SERVICE INSTALLATIONS AND CONNECTIONS AND MAIN SERVICE
RELOCATIONS. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL COORDINATE THE WORK TO BE PERFORMED
BY THE VARIOUS UTILITY COMPANIES, PAY ALL FEES AND SECURE ALL PERMITS FOR
CONNECTIONS, DISCONNECTIONS, RELOCATIONS, INSPECTIONS AND DEMOLITION AS NECESSARY
OR APPROPRIATE.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL MAINTAIN ALL FLOWS AND UTILITY CONNECTIONS TO
EXISTING BUILDINGS, ETC. WITHOUT INTERRUPTION UNLESS/UNTIL AUTHORIZED TO DISCONNECT
BY THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE, OTHER AFFECTED OWNER(S), THE UTILITY COMPANIES AND
JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITIES. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL INSTALL AS NECESSARY TEMPORARY SITE
LIGHTING, GAS, SANITARY, WATER, STORM, ELECTRIC, TELEPHONE AND CABLE SERVICES TO
BUILDING(S) THAT ARE TO REMAIN OPERATIONAL.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE SLEEVES UNDER FOOTINGS AND/OR THROUGH
FOUNDATIONS FOR UTILITY CONNECTIONS.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE ALL BENDS, FITTINGS, ADAPTERS, ETC. AS REQUIRED
FOR PIPE CONNECTIONS TO BUILDING/CANOPY STUB-OUTS, INCLUDING ROOF/FOOTING DRAIN
CONNECTIONS AND ROOF LEADERS, AND TO THE STORM DRAINAGE SYSTEM.

ALL UTILITY CONSTRUCTION IS SUBJECT TO INSPECTION PRIOR TO APPROVAL FOR BACKFILL, IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTILITY COMPANY OR COMPANIES, AND OTHER JURISDICTIONAL
AUTHORITY REQUIREMENTS.

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL RESTORE ANY STRUCTURE, PIPE, PAVEMENT, CURBS,
SIDEWALKS, APPROPRIATE LANDSCAPE AREAS, ETC. DISTURBED DURING CONSTRUCTION TO THE
ORIGINAL CONDITION OR BETTER.

PENDING THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR'S NOTIFICATION OF AND APPROVAL BY THE OWNER'S
REPRESENTATIVE, UTILITY CONNECTION DESIGN AS REFLECTED IN THE PLANS AND PROJECT
MANUAL MAY CHANGE SUBJECT TO UTILITY COMPANY AND JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY REVIEW.

IN THEIR BASE BID.

THE CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE THE UP-CHARGE, IF ANY, TO INSTALL CONCRETE PAVING INSTEAD
OF BITUMINOUS PAVING. THIS PRICE SHALL ALSO INCLUDE THE COSTS TO PROTECT THE NEW
CONCRETE PAVING FROM WINTER CONDITIONS.

1.

DISCLAIMERS:

THIS SET OF DRAWINGS IS INTENDED AS A SET OF GUIDELINES FOR THE PROJECT AND ARE TO BE
USED IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE PROJECT MANUAL AND/OR SUPPLEMENTAL DATA TO BE
PROVIDED BY THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE. THEY MUST BE READ TO INCORPORATE ALL
APPLICABLE FEDERAL, STATE, AND LOCAL CODES.

EXISTING SITE INFORMATION HEREON IS PROVIDED BY THE OWNER, SURVEYOR, PLANS PREPARED
BY OTHERS, AND/OR FIELD SURFACE EVIDENCE. ALL LOCATIONS ARE PRESUMED TO BE
APPROXIMATE. SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS ASSUMES NO LIABILITY FOR INFORMATION
REPRESENTING EXISTING CONDITIONS HEREON. IT IS THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR RESPONSIBILITY
TO THOROUGHLY REVIEW THESE DRAWINGS AND SUPPLEMENTAL OWNER PROVIDED DATA WITH
ACTUAL SITE CONDITIONS. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL NOTE ANY DISCREPANCIES IN THE
DRAWINGS AND ACTUAL SITE CONDITIONS, WHETHER SHOWN ON THE PLANS OR NOT, WITH THE
OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE PRIOR TO BIDDING AND CONSTRUCTION.

THE DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL ASSUME THERE ARE NO UNUSUAL SOIL CONDITIONS,
UNKNOWN UNDERGROUND STRUCTURES OR IMPEDIMENTS, WIND LOADS, AND/OR SIMILAR
UNFORESEEN CIRCUMSTANCES. UNUSUAL CONDITIONS DETECTED BY THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR
SHALL BE IMMEDIATELY REPORTED TO THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE AND MAY REQUIRE
SIGNIFICANT CHANGES TO THESE DRAWINGS.

sevan

ENGINEERING

Corporate Office:

3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
Downers Grove, IL 60515

info@sevansolutions.com www.sevansolutions.com

INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY

REVISIONS

=
©

DATE | DESCRIPTION

03.19.2022|SITE PLAN REVIEW

06.30.2022| REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT

08.05.2022|REVISED PER RIDOT

08.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM

09.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

11.21.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

12.08.2022(REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE

12.13.2022|REVISED SITE PAVING

01.09.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

[Noll el BN o)l O, i BN OO I O N Y K=

01.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
o

02.01.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
[N

02.06.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
No

02.14.2023|REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT

CONSULTANT

SEAL

TIMOTHY KRATZ

\ /
02/15/2023 \/

CUSTOMER

ashoille

Your Hometown Car Wash

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

WASHVILLE CARWASH

PROJECT LOCATION

991-995 W MAIN RD
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842

(NEWPORT COUNTY)

SHEET TITLE

GENERAL NOTES

SHEET MANAGEMENT

PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN Rl

DATE:

CRITERIA: 110" TUNNEL

PROJECT MANAGER:

THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.

REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN|
PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.

(NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022

SHEET NUMBER

G0.02




GPl ’ Engineering
4 Design
Planning
Construction Management
Greenman-Pedersen, Inc.
44 Stiles Road, Suite One
Salem, NH 03079
SITE
PREPARED FOR
GR DEVELOPMENT, LLC
c/o SEVAN SOLUTIONS
3025 HIGHLAND PARKWAY SUITE 850
DOWNERS GROVE, IL 60515
<
@"’é ‘D —
& 0?") A F F
ol L - & % & .
_ . -110___ — X R o 2 q‘? F m
- e MAP 106 LOT 142 g od
/ o i o = N/F MIDDLETOWN ASSOCIATES ROUN[; CONCRETE l_
/ . — 0 _ _ — — —  ¢/o KELLY & PICERNE SOUND. EOURD
— T s g 5 75 LAMBERT LIND HIGHWAY — — DISTURBED i - |
Y s / & 408 — o WARWICK, RI 02886 o N o\ <«
4 T w-——" o TOT PEE S - il VICINITY MAP = 9
T ~ e BT . - e i e [ i, O e P e e
/ S gl == #159___\*5_5‘} 2N B0 i e o e S, "7 / | (NOT TO SCALE) % (]
o ek g Y- - R n Z
& E0F 8 mim —_— - = & ¥ n
AR < / l_ <
4 'l g L . i ;) o
6" ROUND CONCRETE / » / # N / o
BOUND FOUND WITH PIN i/ W/ o 7 N / / - (7p]
GOOD CONDITION ’ NS N L. / © m e
DOWN 0.3’ / S '
) / ~N NOTES.
& 2 / —_— L
A s / = 1 / / 1) ZONE: GENERAL BUSINESS A DISTRICT — GBA 2 P 0
A | / g VERTICAL 4" PVC N y (TRAFFIC SENSITIVE DISTRICT) “ners
; & PIPE o / MIN. LOT SIZE: 12,000 Sq.Ft. << 0O
/ 8 s / / MIN. LOT FRONTAGE: 100 Ft. (300 Ft.) s
" ; & ~ SETBACKS: < E L
) ‘ 3 / & / B MAP 106 LOT 117 FRONT 13 Ft. _j - oY
i/ P N/F PLAZA ASSOCIATES, LLC SIDE t.
® O / c/o DAVID BAZARSKY REAR 20 Ft. 0. (7)) -
1T & 678 AQUIDNECK AVENUE REFER TO THE TOWN OF MIDDLETOWN ZONING ORDINANCE FOR ul 2
W & / PRIVATE RIGHT OF [ T B e B B VERIFICATION, ADDITIONAL RESTRICTIONS AND PERMITTED USES. THE (7p)
’ ) / / WY | ;Eﬁclét?;: 5 [ ZONING INFORMATION SHOWN HEREON IS BASED ON A REVIEW OF THE oY ; ;
LEGEND | / // BOOK 589 PAGE 344 § ' / #957 WEST MAIN ROAD MIDDLETOWN ZONING ORDINANCE. o o
I\~ 40 wioe PRIvATE / 5 y S b | 2) THIS PLAN IS THE RESULT OF AN ON—~THE—GROUND FIELD SURVEY 0 .
| ng F?EFFE‘;‘E‘LCF;ER A / 3 . e = PERFORMED BY THIS OFFICE BETWEEN JANUARY 25 AND MARCH 2, (/p) N LLJ
- VERTICAL CONCRETE CURB 1 / ! & P - & ~ 5 o a!; R BITUMINOUS o n = -
-~ o~ ~ # = - —
o GAS LINE r / ’ r o P AP 106 LOT 116 G ! CONCRETE 3) BEARINGS SHOWN HEREON ARE BASED ON NAD83 RHODE ISLAND L o
MAP 106 LOT 114 ® Y o] o 35
W WATER LINE N/F KENNETH J. ALVES | /| . & s el 19,095 Saq.Ft. ®Q [ ’ STATE PLANE COORDINATE SYSTEM PER GPS OBSERVATIONS (7p]
PO BOX 4360 BTUMINOUS & & / S 3 3|8 : ; PERFORMED BY THIS OFFICE ON JANUARY 25, 2022. — 0O
Q 2 x & b
O L3 TREE gD RTS8 ol I AP 106 LOT 115 ~ | / ’ . 4) ELEVATIONS SHOWN HEREON ARE BASED ON NAVD88 PER GPS < § o >
Q
el GUY WIRE © © 0.435 Ac.x & . =TT | /
o 2 & 5) LOCATION OF UNDERGROUND UTILITIES IS APPROXIMATE ONLY.
s r I #995 WEST MAIN ROAD ) . - k I K ADDITIONAL UNDERGROUND UTILITIES OTHER THAN THOSE SHOWN MAY
e SIGN © A I ; P & , 2 BE ENCOUNTERED. INVERTS ARE LISTED IN A CLOCKWISE DIRECTION
@ 1 o
& SPOT ELEVATION f‘l | | / y \ | ENDING WITH THE INVERT OUT (UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED).
$ $
© D= O s o (< \ % | | 6) THE SURVEY TRACT IS NOT LOCATED IN A SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD
- CATCH 'BASIN N | | SN g \ 54 ~ | | AREA (100 YEAR FLOOD) PER FLOOD INSURANCE RATE MAP NUMBER
& WATER SHUT OFF 2 | ] \ e S s : " < | 44005C0093J, WITH AN EFFECTIVE DATE OF SEPTEMBER 04, 2013.
& & ~ — S \
PROPERTY LINE 0 K Gl
or \ 2 [ 5 A \ ! ‘ | 7) THIS PLAN IS TO BE FILED WITH THE MIDDLETOWN LAND EVIDENCE
ABUTTER PROPERTY LINE ' ™~ N\ RECORDS.
-- ZONING DISTRICT LINE & ) ;53’@ \ 2 L \ '
o N Q‘;) d h 8
S § / BITUMINOUS 6'1 | 0
IRON ROD FOUND /’ o CONCREIE . > F
5/8" DIAMETER % w o
GOéD CONDITION I "CONGRETE. ; / 2° ( i / Qe
! DOWN 0.1’ T NON—TANGENT / K \ } '
e \ o | 4=0011843 / ‘ oriL Hoe Founo |/ |/ REVISIONS
SPIKE IN UTILITY f R=30.00 IN CONCRETE
POLE §#281A © \ L=47.28" (47.29 R) / 5 SIDEWALK \
ELEV.=106.54 <] sl / © & & GOOD CONDITION 6"X6" STONE BOUND WITH
=\ \ ChB=S74"49’09"W . 7% \ AR \ S Hote Fouih
T \ |t ChD=42.54 / A .9 . R\ CONCRETE SIDEWALK
V4 N 2. D CONCRETE | VERTICAL 4 A GOOD CONDITION
\L - " / ‘{/' \ Ew\ o 8 s CERTIFICATION
-~ e I"‘-..“ Q) I% E a
/ ~= 2 1 \ .
— e | < A P ~ o o \ & x THIS SURVEY HAS BEEN CONDUCTED AND THE PLAN HAS BEEN
@ —_— == St ' ' v . “40'01"E- = & PREPARED PURSUANT TO 435—-RICR—00—00—1.9 OF THE RULES AND
: 169.83 es \ N29°40°01"E
M Lo oot - 2 — 5 = et == S ————— REGULATIONS ADOPTED BY THE RHODE ISLAND STATE BOARD OF
FF W P & H e & \—4" ROUND CONCRETE & & \{i & & REGISTRATION FOR PROFESSIONAL LAND SURVEYORS ON NOVEMBER 25,
i ’ N ) BOUND WITH PIN FOUND HANDICAP 2015 AS FOLLOWS:
m?:omb W'E(\)TFEFR (??g.r) /\ G00D CONDITION ACCESSIBLE RAMP /\
| e / TYPE_OF BOUNDARY SURVEY: MEASUREMENT SPECIFICATION:
CONCRETE OVERHEAD IRON ROD FOUND OVERHEAD
S (TYP.) X APPROXIMATE LOCATION OF WIRES (TYP.) COMPREHENSIVE BOUNDARY SURVEY CLASS |
| APPROSEWER NG PER 015 \ . e \ G WATER. LINE Rzg'ggg_\ ) - DATA ACCUMULATION SURVEY CLASS Il
2 6 o ¢ c 6 8 REERDS 6 6 c G ¢ 6 c 6 6 6 B e e TOPOGRAPHIC SURVEY ACCURACY CLASS T-2
ézz:z:z===::::z:==:=::-_—-__:-_::—:=:::::::;::;—_::::::—..:::::::::i==::::::::::‘—"—::::::i:':zz=::::=iz:= ___________________ 1. MISC. REVISIONS 6/2/22
w W W w OVEREHEA% W |r W w W W w w W \\ W W w w W w w W \ w w W NO. REVISION DATE
WIRES (TYP.
- I WEST MAIN ROAD - ROUTE 114 MARCH 21, 2022
SIDEWALK \ (PUBLIC — VARIABLE WIDTH) DRAWN/DESIGN BY] CHECKED BY
¢ o " \ CSS/AKC JPB
— vCC !—':&6‘“ o'\"\ @Tj‘ﬁ P
< {& g & v &
"t |
8 ~ . — & ; N
@ o - - e = b @ﬁ,——?
MAP 106 LOT 170 < L%/) G {é (
N/F ROYAL PLAZA LLC A i’
c/o CARRIAGE HOUSE INN BY: ___
93 MIANTONOMI AVENUE PROFESSIONAL LAND SURVEYOR EXISTING
PLAN REFERENCES: 900K 1634 PAGE 236 CONDITIONS
TOWN OF MIDDLETOWN LAND EVIDENCE RECORDS #1 CORPORATE PLACE PLAN
1)  ULTRASONIC MRI CAR WASH AND GAS STATION; PREPARED
BY NORTHEAST ENGINEERS AND CONSULTANTS, INC.;
SCALE:1"=20"; DATED: JUNE 12, 2018 —
| | OWNER OF RECORD: SCE
2) 1954 PLAT PREPARED BY GARDNER C. EASTON RECORDED 0 20 50 100 ASSESSORS PLAT 106 LOTS 115 & 116 1"=20
AS PART OF BOOK 589 PAGE 344. —_— S— E)GT(-J ?ﬂlﬁ'rsﬁ%\ééll__c
A NEX-220003
3) PLAT SHOWING LAND IN MIDDLETOWN TAKEN IN FEE SCALE: 1" = 20 WESTBURY, NY 11590
SIMPLE ON BEHALF OF THE STATE OF RHODE ISLAND & BOOK 1551 PAGE 0113
PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS BY THE DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC 1 OF 1
WORKS; HIGHWAY PLAT NO. 952; DATED MARCH 13, 1956.




FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Clients\Siteology\Washville\Main St Middletown R\DS\ConDocs\C1.10.dwg LAST SAVED BY: Pastrana, Osvaldo SAVED DATE: 2/15/2023 1:33 PM PLOTTED: 2/15/2023 4:02 PM

40" WIDE PRIVATE
RIGHT OF WAY PER
PLAN REFERENCE #1

AP 106 LOT 114
N/F KENNETH J. ALVES
PO BOX 4360
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842
BOOK 429 PAGE 249

#999 WEST MAIN ROAD

™ /

CONCRETE BOUND
FOUND WITH PIN 6”
DIAMETER DOWN 0.3’

/
\9“! X
6
)
- T

TBM—1
SPIKE IN UTILI
POLE #281A ©
ELEV.=106.54 o\
%l \ \
\/ A

N
E.S.H.L. PLAT NO. 952 o /\

. o4
: =
IRON ROD@{&?UND I A s
5/%’ 2 los{\g) <
IRF & . > ITUM
DOWN 0.1 \ | |« * "CONCRRTE,

AP 106 LOT 142
N/F MIDDLETOWN ASSOCIATES

. c/o KELLY & PICERNE
— & 75 LAMB

K LIND HIGHWAY
_ —WARWICK, RI 02886
P — BOOK 101 PAG
. — /_/
__  —— T #969 WEST MAIN ROAD
/ //
108 — ——
P S
07— - - -
J——
—— 6;_3"‘—/ J— —_—
\66/ 2° —_

-_— e ————— e — _—eey —— i — —— — — e
303 ~
X 10563 )
TGBBEPKS 3 Q
N
\Q /

CONCRETE BOUND
FOUND WITH PIN 6"
DIAMETER DOWN 0.3’

PRIVATE RIGHT OF
WAY PER PLAN
REFERENCE #1
BOOK 589 PAGE 14

/bb(

/ AP 106 LOT 117/

N/F PLAZA ASSOCIATES, LLC
c/o DAVID BAZARSKY
678 AQUIDNECK AVENUE
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842

BOOK 1065 PAGE 240

#957 WEST MAIN ROAD

/ v AP 106 LOT 116

N 0.45 Ac.t / r
& o VERHEAD
AP 10/6 LOT 115 #991 WEST MAIN ROAD T WROES%W,)\ a
Y =
Ao e / @”Pp o / 1|//|
#995 WEST MAN/%OAD - I g
@/ |
R — |
<~ L@‘J'QZ

/

105
) / IRON ROD FOUND —102.86
2 UP 0.2" BeffTY-2/BENT

|
N ll/ DRILL HOLE FOUND IN

100.29
SBF DH 6X6 FLUSH

103
PROIZHOLE FOUND IN
COMCRETE SIDEWALK \ Q|

TBM—2 |
SPIKE IN UTILJ
POLE #NEFTZ83

01) -

STONE BOUND FOUND
DRILL HOLE IN
CONCRETE WALK 6X6
FLUSH

ELEV.

20

—_— L\ I N— em—

i— IS vee— IS NIS /NS NGS [CILS NLS™ LS
IS INLS INLS INLS INLS INLS WIS —55 o 9 <
NS SVvO SVvD SVO SVO - SVO SV SVO SVH SV SVO SVO )
—— SVO SVO SVO SVO SVO SVvD MAG NAIL 106/ . \@ .
FOUND . 103.12
DHF OVERHEAD
’ APPROXIMATE LOCATION OF WIRES (TYP.)’\\\
SEWER LINE PER OIS
—SMWN— — — — — — — — - —SMN— — — — — — — RECORDSN - = - - - - - — — —SAN-*- - - - - — — — — —SM\N- - - - - - — — — — —SAN— - - = = — — — —95
51 50 : 49 48.
W W W ovERAEAD W I W W W W \ W W W W W W W
EXISTING FRAME AND GRATE TO BE REPLACED WITH
A 4-FLANGE HEAVY DUTY FRAME AND GRATE. Rl Rriyf=103.17 WEST MAlN ROAD - ROUTE 1 14 PROXIMATE LOCATION OF
STANDARD 6.3.4 - HIGH CAPACITY FRAME AND GRATE WATER LINE PER GIS
(BICYCLE SAFE) WITH A 4TH FLANGE SHALL BE USED. (PUBLIC — VARIABLE WIDTH) RECORDS
*\Qw ' vee I:' '\6‘j t\w \/-\Q AP . o
S & Yo "
. i \ \

DEMOLITION SITE PLAN

SCALE: 1"=20'-0"

@ DEMOLITION SITE PLAN KEYNOTES:

1 SAWCUT, REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF SITE PAVEMENT AS REQUIRED TO ALLOW FOR NEW
CONSTRUCTION.

SAWCUT, REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF CONCRETE WALK.
REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF PORTION OF CONCRETE CURB.
REMOVE TREE. REFER TO L1.20.

REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF EXISTING SANITARY PIPE.

uau B~ W N

sevan

ENGINEERING

Corporate Office:

3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
Downers Grove, IL 60515

info@sevansolutions.com www.sevansolutions.com

INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY

REVISIONS

=
©

DATE | DESCRIPTION

03.19.2022|SITE PLAN REVIEW

06.30.2022| REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT

08.05.2022|REVISED PER RIDOT

08.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM

09.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

11.21.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

12.08.2022|REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE

12.13.2022|REVISED SITE PAVING

01.09.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

|| J|lOOU|B|lwW|IN|FL O

01.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
o

02.01.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

[N
[N

02.06.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

[N
No

02.14.2023|REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT

CONSULTANT

SEAL

TIMOTHY KRATZ

\ /
02/15/2023 \/

CUSTOMER

ashpille

Your Hometown Car Wash

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

WASHVILLE CARWASH

PROJECT LOCATION

991-995 W MAIN RD
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842

(NEWPORT COUNTY)

SHEET TITLE

DEMOLITION SITE PLAN

SHEET MANAGEMENT

PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN RI

DATE:

CRITERIA: 110" TUNNEL

PROJECT MANAGER:

THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.

REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN
PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.

(NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022

SHEET NUMBER

C1.10




FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Clients\Siteology\Washville\Main St Middletown R\DS\ConDocs\C1.11.dwg LAST SAVED BY: Pastrana, Osvaldo SAVED DATE: 2/15/2023 3:56 PM PLOTTED: 2/15/2023 4:03 PM

SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL AND MAINTENANCE NOTES: 9. INSTALL SILT FENCE AS INDICATED IN THE DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL, PER ATTACHED
DETAILS, AND AT ADDITIONAL AFFECTED AREAS AS NECESSARY. 13. IF ANY PUMP-DRIVEN DEWATERING IS NEEDED, IT SHALL BE DISCHARGED THROUGH A FILTER BAG 23. EXISTING DRAINAGE OUTLET FOR SITE: OVERLAND FLOW TO WEST MAIN ROAD ROW STORM CONSTRUCTION SEQUENCE:

1. ASOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL PERMIT, OR SIMILAR PERMIT FROM THE A.  SILT FENCE SHALL BE INSPECTED ONCE A WEEK UNDER ANY CIRCUMSTANCES, WITHIN 24 OVER A WELL-VEGETATED AREA. THE PUMP MUST DISCHARGE AT A NON-EROSIVE VELOCITY. IF WATER MANAGEMENT SYSTEM s e U a n
JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY, MUST BE SECURED AND POSTED ON-SITE PRIOR TO ANY EARTH HOURS OF RAINFALL, AND DAILY DURING A PROLONGED RAIN EVENT. REQUIRED NECESSARY, AN APPROVED ENERGY DISSIPATER MAY BE USED. IF ANY DEWATERING IS NEEDED OR 1. INSTALL TRAFFIC AND PEDESTRIAN SAFETY BARRICADES.

CHANGES. MAINTENANCE SHALL BE PROVIDED PROMPTLY. ANTICIPATED, CONTRACTOR SHALL SUBMIT A DEWATERING PLAN FOR REVIEW. 24. PROPOSED DRAINAGE OUTLET FOR SITE: CAPTURE, TREAT, DETAIN, AND OUTLET AT A CONTROLLED ENGINEERING
B.  BUILD-UP OF SEDIMENT SHALL BE REMOVED WHEN SEDIMENT ACCUMULATED TO 1/3 OF RATE TO WEST MAIN ROAD ROW STORM WATER MANAGEMENT SYSTEM. 2. INSTALL TEMPORARY EROSION CONTROL MEASURES. PROTECT ALL AREAS THAT COULD ALLOW

2. ALLSOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL (SESC) WORK SHALL CONFORM TO THE THE HEIGHT OF THE SILT FENCE. 14. CONSTRUCTION ACCESS TO BE FROM THE EXISTING APPROACH, OR OTHER EXPRESSLY DESIGNATED SEDIMENT TO MIGRATE OFF-SITE VIA SURFACE RUNOFF, VIA ENCLOSED DRAINAGE SYSTEMS OR

STANDARDS AND SPECIFICATIONS OF THE JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY. C.  IFSILT FENCE DECOMPOSES OR BECOMES INEFFECTIVE PRIOR TO THE END OF EXPECTED AREA. NO ACCESS SHOULD BE MADE FROM ADJACENT PROPERTIES WITHOUT PRIOR CONSENT. 25. TOTAL AREA OF DISTURBANCE: 0.95+ AC VIA TRACKING CAUSED BY CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT, ETC. EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL
USABLE LIFE AND THE BARRIER IS STILL REQUIRED, THE SILT FENCE SHALL BE REPLACED MEASURES SHALL BE INSTALLED PRIOR TO ANY EARTH MOVING ACTIVITIES.
3. EROSION AND ANY SEDIMENTATION FROM WORK ON THIS SITE SHALL BE CONTAINED ON THE SITE PROMPTLY. 15.  ALL MUD, DIRT, AND DEBRIS TRACKED ONTO ANY ROADWAY SHALL BE REMOVED IMMEDIATELY BY 26.  SOILTYPE(S): PmB: PITTSTOWN SILT LOAM, 3 TO 8 PERCENT SLOPES
AND NOT ALLOWED TO COLLECT ON ANY OFF SITE AREAS OR IN WATERWAYS. WATERWAYS THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR. UD: UDORTHENTS-URBAN LAND COMPLEX 3. COMPLETE REQUIRED REMOVALS AND LEGALLY DISPOSE OF DEBRIS AND WASTE OFF-SITE.
INCLUDE BOTH NATURAL AND MAN-MADE OPEN DITCHES, STREAMS, STORM DRAINS, LAKES AND 10. INSTALL INLET FILTERS ON ALL PAVEMENT CATCH BASINS PER DETAIL. Ur: URBAN LAND
PONDS. A.  INLET FILTERS SHALL BE INSPECTED ONCE A WEEK UNDER ANY CIRCUMSTANCES, WITHIN 24 16. STREETS AND/OR PARKING AREAS WILL BE SCRAPED AND SWEPT ON A DAILY BASIS BY THE 4. PERFORM MASS GRADING AND CONSTRUCT SITE IMPROVEMENTS.
HOURS OF RAINFALL, AND DAILY DURING A PROLONGED RAIN EVENT. REQUIRED GENERAL CONTRACTOR. Corporate Office:

4. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL STAGE ALL SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL MAINTENANCE SHALL BE PROVIDED PROMPTLY. 5. DAILY OR AS REQUIRED, CONSTRUCT TEMPORARY BERMS, DITCHES, SILT FENCING, SEDIMENT 3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
(SESC) WORK AS DIRECTED IN THE DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL, AND AS OTHERWISE B.  BUILD-UP OF SEDIMENT AND DEBRIS SHALL BE REMOVED PROMPTLY. 17. ALL DISTURBED AREAS SHALL BE MAINTAINED FOR DUST CONTROL. SPRINKLING TANK TRUCKS TRAPS, ETC. SEED AND MULCH AS REQUIRED. D G IL '60515
NECESSARY OR APPROPRIATE TO ENSURE PROGRESSIVE STABILIZATION OF DISTURBED EARTH. C.  IF FILTER FABRIC DECOMPOSES OR BECOMES INEFFECTIVE PRIOR TO THE END OF EXPECTED SHALL BE AVAILABLE AT ALL TIMES AND USED ON HAUL ROADS, ON-SITE DISTURBED AREAS, AND CONSTRUCTION SITE DEWATERING NOTES . owners farove, .

USABLE LIFE AND THE BARRIER IS STILL REQUIRED, THE FILTER FABRIC SHALL BE REPLACED OTHER AREAS WHERE DUST BECOMES A PROBLEM AS A RESULT OF CONSTRUCTION ACTIVITY. 6. INSPECT AND MAINTAIN ALL EROSION CONTROL MEASURES PER JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY info@sevansolutions.com - www.sevansolutions.com

5. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR INSTALLATION AND MAINTENANCE OF PROMPTLY. TAKE CARE WHEN DEWATERING CONSTRUCTION SITES. DO NOT PUMP SEDIMENT-LADEN WATER REQUIREMENTS. INTEGRITY [ RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY

SESC DEVICES. 18. PERMANENT SESC MEASURES FOR ANY DISTURBED LAND AREA SHALL BE COMPLETED BY THE DIRECTLY TO LAKES, STREAMS, COUNTY DRAINS, STORM DRAINS, WETLANDS OR OTHER
11. INSTALL DRAIN GUARD ON ALL CATCH BASINS PER DETAIL, SEED OR SOD THE AREA BETWEEN THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR WITHIN FIVE (5) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER FINAL GRADING OR THE FINAL ENVIRONMENTALLY SENSITIVE AREAS. THE PROPER WAY TO DEWATER A CONSTRUCTION SITE IS AS 7. REMOVE TEMPORARY EROSION CONTROL MEASURES WHEN SITE IS STABILIZED.

6. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL IMPLEMENT AND MAINTAIN THE SESC MEASURES AS SHOWN IN SILT FENCE AND THE INLET. EARTH CHANGE HAS BEEN COMPLETED. WHEN IT IS NOT POSSIBLE TO PERMANENTLY STABILIZE A FOLLOWS: REVISIONS
THE DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL BEFORE, AND AT ALL TIMES DURING, THE CONSTRUCTION A.  DRAIN GUARDS SHALL BE INSPECTED ONCE A WEEK UNDER ANY CIRCUMSTANCES, WITHIN DISTURBED AREA AFTER EARTH CHANGE ACTIVITY CEASES, TEMPORARY SESC MEASURES SHALL BE NO.l DATE | DESCRIPTION
OF THIS PROJECT. ANY MODIFICATIONS OR ADDITIONS TO SESC MEASURES DUE TO 24 HOURS OF RAINFALL, AND DAILY DURING A PROLONGED RAIN EVENT. IMPLEMENTED IMMEDIATELY. ALL TEMPORARY SESC MEASURES SHALL BE MAINTAINED UNTIL e PLACE A GEOTEXTILE FILTER BAG OR GEOTUBE ON THE END OF THE DISCHARGE HOSE ;

CONSTRUCTION OR CHANGED CONDITIONS SHALL BE COMPLIED WITH AS REQUIRED OR AS B.  BUILD-UP OF SEDIMENT SHALL BE REMOVED WHEN SEDIMENT ACCUMULATES TO 1/3 TO PERMANENT SESC MEASURES ARE IMPLEMENTED. : 0 [03.19.2022(SITE PLAN REVIEW
DIRECTED BY THE JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY. 1/2 OF THE HEIGHT OF THE SILT FENCE. *  DISCHARGE DIRECTLY TO A SEDIMENT BASIN. 1 106302022 REVISED PER RDEM AND RIDOT
C. IF FILTER FABRIC DECOMPOSES OR BECOME INEFFECTIVE PRIOR TO THE END OF EXPECTED 19. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL FINAL GRADE, ESTABLISH VEGETATION, AND/OR LANDSCAPE o DISCHARGE TO A WELL VEGETATED AREA (NOT WETLANDS). LEGEND - SEE SHEET C5.00 FOR ASSOCIATED DETAILS —

7. IF ANY OF THE SESC MEASURES ON THE SITE ARE DEEMED INADEQUATE OR INEFFECTIVE, THE USABLE LIFE AND THE BARRIER IS STILL REQUIRED, THE FILTER FENCE SHALL BE REPLACED ALL DISTURBED AREAS NOT BUILT OR PAVED UPON. e DISCHARGE INTO A CONSTRUCTED CONTAINMENT AREA. 2 {08.05.2022|REVISED PER RIDOT
JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY HAS THE RIGHT TO REQUIRE ADDITIONAL SESC MEASURES AT THE PROMPTLY. 3 108.25 2022| REVISED PER RIDEM
EXPENSE OF THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR. 20. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL REMOVE ALL TEMPORARY SESC DEVICES AFTER PERMANENT DISSIPATE ENERGY TO PREVENT SCOURING, AND INSPECT DEWATERING OPERATIONS SEVERAL TIMES U%wawwq

12. ALL STOCKPILED SOILS SHALL BE MAINTAINED IN SUCH A WAY AS TO PREVENT EROSION FROM STABILIZATION IS ESTABLISHED. DAILY. CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE TOTOSOTOTO 4 |09.29.2022)REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

8. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL INSPECT THE SESC DEVICES ONCE A WEEK UNDER ANY LEAVING THE SITE. SILT FENCE MUST BE INSTALLED AROUND THE PERIMETER OF THE STOCKPILE. IF P0-9-0-0-0- 5 [11.21.2022| REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
CIRCUMSTANCES, WITHIN 24 HOURS OF RAINFALL, AND DAILY DURING A PROLONGED RAIN EVENT. THE STOCKPILE WILL BE ON SITE FOR MORE THAN 30 DAYS, THE STOCKPILE MUST BE SEEDED. 21. 3-4" OF TOPSOIL WILL BE USED WHERE VEGETATION IS REQUIRED. c%c%q%o@%c%éoo = 113.08.2022 REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE
A LOG OF INSPECTION REPORTS SHALL BE MAINTAINED AND ACCESSIBLE IN ACCORDANCE WITH A.  IMMEDIATELY AFTER SEEDING, MULCH ALL SEEDED AREAS WITH UNWEATHERED SMALL S
NATIONAL POLLUTION DISCHARGE ELIMINATION SYSTEM (NPDES) REQUIREMENTS. ANY REQUIRED GRAIN STRAW, SPREAD UNIFORMLY AT THE RATE OF 1 TO 2 TONS PER ACRE OR 100 22. SLOPES STEEPER THAN 1V:6H (16%) SHALL BE STABILIZED WITH EROSION CONTROL BLANKETS. 7 12.13.2022|REVISED SITE PAVING
MAINTENANCE SHALL BE PROVIDED PROMPTLY. POUNDS (2-3 BALES) PER 1000 SQUARE FEET. 8 101.09.2023 REVISED PER EASEMENT

B.  THE MULCH SHOULD BE ANCHORED WITH DISC TYPE MULCH ANCHORING TOOL OR OTHER CONSTRUCTION FENCE - =
MEANS AS APPROVED BY THE JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY. MULCH MATTING MAY BE USED 9 |01.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
IN'LIEU OF LOOSE MULCH. 10 {02.01.2023(REVISED PER EASEMENT
SILT FENCE — // // 11 [02.06.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
12 {02.14.2023| REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT
/0 L/—\W\ LIND HIGHWAY
- nggKW‘%} RFLA%QES% LIMITS OF DISTURBANCE
’,_/
- ’/#?3'69 WEST MAIN ROAD
- — INLET FILTER. Q}
P
- TEMPORARY SOIL STOCKPILE AREA r T |
/gﬁ“ S - SURROUND WITH COMPOST FILTER !_ _______ |
v -
_— @ﬁ?”/ . ; $ . SOCK. CONSULTANT
\Q@
--—----—----—----
| ————— od R ~ ~ PRIVATE RIGHT OF
e P — WAY PER PLAN
’ : i REFERENCE #1 RHODE ISLAND STORMWATER MANAGEMENT, DESIGN, AND INSTALLATION RULES:
40 WIDE PRIVATE ’ ,
RIGHT OF WAY PER. |  » W't ,  —  ~ e __ BOOK 589 PAGE 14
PLAN REFERENCE #1 ‘ o \ 8.16.D.4 Preserve Topsoil: Site owners and operators must preserve existing topsoil on the
] > | construction site to the maximum extent feasible and as necessary to support healthy
| vegetation. If it is determined that preserving native topsoil is infeasible, the reasons why this SEAL
N S was determined must be addressed in the SESC Plan.
= Va>Y
\ AP 106 LOT 117 8.16.D.5 Stabilize Soils: Stabilization of disturbed areas must, at a minimum, be initiated immediately
N/F PLAZA ASSOCIATES, LLC whenever any clearing, grading, excavating or other earth disturbance activities have TIMOTHY KRATZ
————— /o DAVID BAZARSKY permanently ceased on any portion of the site, or temporarily ceased on any portion of the
678 AQUIDNECK AVENUE site and will not resume for a period exceeding 14 calendar days. Stabilization must be
| MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842 completed using vegetative stabilization measures or using alternative measures whenever
BOOK 1063 PAGE 240 vegetative measures are deemed impracticable or during periods of drought. All disturbed
| soils exposed prior to October 15th shall be seeded by that date. Any such areas which do not
#957 WEST MAIN ROAD have adequate vegetative stabilization by November 15th must be stabilized through the use
of non-vegetative erosion control measures. If work continues within any of these areas during
ﬁ\ the period from October 15th through April 15th, care must be taken to ensure that only the
< area required for that day’s work is exposed, and all erodible soil must be restabilized within 5
/ working days. In limited circumstances, stabilization may not be required if the intended

function of a specific area of the site necessitates that it remain disturbed.

\ J

02/15/2023 \_/

8.16.D.8 Establish Temporary Controls for the Protection of Post-Construction Stormwater Control
Measures: Temporary measures shall be installed to protect permanent or long-term
stormwater control and treatment measures as they are installed and throughout the CUSTOMER
construction phase of the project so that they will function properly when they are brought
online. The plan shall identify areas where infiltration measures are proposed and provide
measures to restrict construction activity to prevent compaction of the area. In cases where
this is not possible to avoid the area the Plan must include methods to restore the infiltration
capacity of the soils.

@
8.16.D.11 Properly Design Constructed Stormwater Conveyance Channels: Temporary conveyance as&ville

practices must be sized to handle the peak flow from the 10-year, 24-hour Type Il design Y, h
storm. Temporary conveyance measures may be required to be sized to handle the peak flow Our Hometown Car Was
from larger design storms as determined on a case-by-case basis.

AP 106 LOT 114
N/F KENNETH J. ALVES
PO BOX 4360
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842
BOOK 429 PAGE 249

#999 WEST MAIN ROAD

¥

8.16.D.12 Retain Sediment On-Site

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

a. The SESC Plan shall contain a combination of practices that control erosion, control run-off,
and control sediment. The combination of practices must be designed to prevent
discharges of sediment. All plans shall include inlet protection, construction entrances, and
containment of stockpiled materials.

b. For Disturbed Areas <1 Acre: Those areas with a common drainage location that serves an WASHVI I.I.E CARWASH

area with less than 1 acre disturbed at one time, a combination of phasing, stabilization
and conveyances that provide run-off control will be sufficient.

SOIL TYPE: Ur

)
<

/

wl

c. For Disturbed Areas 1to 5 Acres: Those areas with a common drainage location that
serves an area between 1 and 5 acres disturbed at one time, a temporary sediment trap
must be provided where attainable and where the sediment trap is only intended to be
used for a period of 6 months or less. For longer term projects with a common drainage PROJECT LOCATION
location that serves between 1 and 5 acres disturbed at one time, a temporary sediment
basin must be provided where attainable. Temporary sediment trapping practices must be

sized to have a total storage volume capable of storing 1 inch of runoff from the

contributing area or 134 cubic yards per acre of drainage area. A minimum of 50% of the 991'995 W MAIN RD
total volume shall be storage below the outlet (wet storage). The Rhode Island Soil Erosion

and Sediment Control Handbook provides the recommended and primary means to MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842
achieve this performance criteria.

\/

o my y -
/ H]Q s T iy - d. For Disturbed Areas > 5 Acres: Those areas with a common drainage location that serves
S ‘ _ L — W an area with greater than 5 acres disturbed at one time, a temporary (or permanent) (NEWPORT COUNTY)
- & sediment basin must be provided where attainable until final stabilization of the site is

S L 2 = lete. The Rhode Island Soil Erosi d Sediment Control Handbook ides th
V\I@:ﬁq— INLS —\QG@V’—’I/\ILS ST LSS N 1S INLS NLS ——— INLS ——— INLS complete. The Rhode Island Soil Erosion and Sediment Control Handbook provides the SHEET TITLE

E.S.H.L. PLAT NO. 952

// X— SN . . ; o
S R, — &  INIS S5 <NIS ——FNLS —— IS ¢ NLS —# NLS V\U.\§ S recommended and primary means to achieve this performance criteria. The volume of wet
ANLS ———— INIS ———— WIS ———— WIS ———— NLS ——— WIS V\U;QS*I & LS & @4’/5% & & © storage shall be at least twice the sediment storage volume and shall have a minimum

1 depth of 2 feet. Sediment storage volume must accommodate a minimum of 1 year of

L predicted sediment load. See the sediment volume formula in the Rhode Island Soil SOIL EROSION AN D

- . RIM=103.17 . . .
- - Erosion and Sediment Control Handbook as the recommended and primary means to

- . ' achieve this performance criteria. In addition to sediment storage volume and wet storage
- - APPROSXQWETRE LL‘SEATP‘SRN gg . volume, the sediment basin shall provide adequate residence storage volume to provide a SEDI M ENTATION
minimum 10 hours residence time for a 10 -year frequency, 24 hour duration, Type IlI

- RECORDS
- - \’ - — = = = —_— == == = — _ = == = — = — — distribution storm. To the maximum extent practicable, outlet structures must be utilized CONTROL SITE PLAM

@: —_—— — = — T == — — — = — — | that withdraw water from the surface of temporary sedimentation basins, if required or
specified by the designer, for the purpose of minimizing the discharge of pollutants.
Exceptions may include periods of extended cold weather, where alternative outlets are
required during frozen periods. If such a device is infeasible for portions of or the entire SHEET MANAGEMENT

_ - : tructi iod justificati t be made in the SESC Plan.
RIM=103.17 WEST MAIN ROAD - ROUTE 114 construction period justification must be made in the an TN O DETOWNR

(PUBLIC — VARIABLE WIDTH) ' DATE: -
CRITERIA: 110" TUNNEL
2 CONSTRUCTION OPERATION TIME SCHEDULE WEEK PROJECT MANAGER:

THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.

/
=T

REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN

& CONSTRUCTION SEQUENCE 2146 |8(10(12|14|16|18|20 |22
PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.
INSTALL SESC MEASU RES (NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)

COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022
DEMOLITION
EXCAVATION SHEET NUMBER

BACKFILL
SESC MEASURES INSPECTIONS AND MAINTENANCE C 1 1 1
COMPLETE EARTH MOVEMENTS ]

FINAL GRADING, SEEDING AND MULCHING

SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL SITE PLAM

SCALE: 1"=20"-0" 0 20’ 40’

N|[o|uv (s |WIN|=




FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Clients\Siteology\Washville\Main St Middletown R\DS\ConDocs\C1.20.dwg LAST SAVED BY: Pastrana, Osvaldo SAVED DATE: 2/15/2023 3:49 PM PLOTTED: 2/15/2023 4:03 PM

230.0' LONG 6' HIGH SCREEN FENCE ALONG PROPERTY LINE - COLOR TO MATCH THE PROPOSED BUILDING VENEER - SEE DETAIL 2/C5.02

O 00 N O U1 B W N =

[ T I S S T S = S S S T
O LW o N o Ul W NN R, O

21
22

23
24

o o0 ® =

E.S.H.L. PLAT NO. 952

7
91.4 22.0
|
- eme o eee—— o e e—— e o ep—— —__ e—— ) — e e——— *ﬁ — < — |
TAPER CURB FROM |
. _ | 6"HIGHTO 3" HIGH
S Ga . OVER 3' l \
N T___Lil_ﬁ\\ |
| in 0 ,
| R3L <:| o <:I l | R20
| 0 mm il =) | R l o
| . ) l | 3" HIGH CAPE S
| " LT &= T
S \
] l
I | @ S E oS ) _ | l
| : 0 <X \ 3 SPACES @ 22.0' = 66.0' = \\ \
| . \ R20 > | N % N l
- RS
: N A L EMPLOYEE PARKING SPACES V S \ \
| |
1 ‘ \ T
| RN
117 || 14.0 204 | CAR WASH ,
i 4,201 S F. R20
RS’ 110' TUNNEL 205.:{> \ | _
| ~— FFE = 104.40 : | | N
I R31' 50 | Rs| e w\ | 3
307\ == . T\ \ .
BICYCLE s , : ' ~ 223
l PARKING —f— ;j | ‘B‘ i @ 50 14.0 NOONY, 150 I
| _ ~ — l } |
| g R e & o / = N
| @ . ) T TN ll Ny H |
I i d ok 3" HIGH CAPE
| 120 - ‘ COD BERM
§ @_/ e @\\ J\ / |
| A\ : 1
I\ AT N\
N P\ R 2 s AN
S | 80 ’ | 153 ] 9.9 2
1T 120 i § 7 SPACES @ 14.0' = 98.0' “
| N : |
\ o
l | N S | <
| N L= - .
| \ 1 1
|| — NP TYP. 8 SPACES @ 14.0'=112.0 V\ 24.0'
g %'l 777777 A - 7777771
e -C) 13 l
\ 9 TYP |
i o3 @
) - TAPER CURB FROM
N\ T T T T T N T T T T I L — | & HiGHTO 3" HicH
= OVER 3'
E.S.H.L. PLAT NO. 952 7 N _ . _ Al
$%O @ _E: {\CS)O L i I\ $(S-3O
@ )
24.0' \ @ 33.7 187" 46.5 28.2' 24.0' 15.5'
17.8' ,
60 60 6.0
O
413" 124.0 WEST MAIN ROAD - ROUTE 114 345"
(PUBLIC — VARIABLE WIDTH)
[

DIMENSION CONTROL SITE PLAN

PROPOSED SITE IMPROVEMENTS

TRASH ENCLOSURE, CONCRETE PAD AND PROTECTIVE BOLLARDS. SEE ARCH PLANS.
NOT USED.

PAY STATION/CANOPY.

PAY STATION ISLAND.

ASPHALT PAVEMENT. PER GEOTECH REPORT RECOMMENDATION. SEE DETAIL 9/C5.01
CONCRETE SIDEWALK. WIDTH VARIES SEE PLAN.

ACCESSIBLE CONCRETE CURB RAMP. SEE DETAIL 6/C5.01.

TRANSFORMER PAD PER SERVICE PROVIDER SPECIFICATIONS.

SITE ID SIGN.

CONCRETE CURB. SEE DETAIL 7/C5.01.

STORM WATER STRUCTURE. SEE STORM WATER MANAGEMENT PLAN C1.31.

4" PAINTED PARKING STRIPE. SEE DETAIL 10/C5.01.

PAINTED DIRECTIONAL ARROW. SEE DETAIL 10/C5.01.

VACUUM CANOPY. BY VENDOR.

BARRIER-FREE PARKING STALL. SEE DETAIL 5/C5.01.

BARRIER-FREE PARKING SIGNS. SEE DETAIL 8/C5.01.

R5-1"DO NOT ENTER" SIGN

R1-1"STOP" SIGN

R3-2 "NO RIGHT TURN" WITH R6-1L "ONE WAY" SIGN ON SAME POST

6' TRANSITION CURB AND 5' WIDE CONCRETE SIDEWALK - SEE RIDOT STANDARD DETAILS
"7.1.2";"7.6.0";"43.1.0"; "43.4.1"

5" WIDE CONCRETE APRON - SEE RIDOT STANDARD DETAILS "43.4.1"; "43.5.0"

CLOSE EXISTING CURB CUT MATCH CURB MATERIAL AND ELEVATIONS. CONCRETE SIDEWALK
TO MATCH EXISTING - SEE RIDOT STANDARD DETAILS "7.1.0"; "7.6.0" ; "43.1.0"

TRASH RECEPTACLE AT BASE OF VACUUM CANOPY. BY VENDOR.
2.5" WIDE PLANTING AREA. REFER TO LANDSCAPE PLANS.

GENERAL SITE NOTES

ALL DIMENSIONS ARE TO FACE OF CURB UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE.
NOTIFY OWNER OF ANY DISCREPANCIES.
SEE SURVEY FOR ALL EXISTING CONDITIONS.

ALL WORK IN PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAYS SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH ALL STATE AND LOCAL
REQUIREMENTS AND STANDARDS.

SCALE: 1"=20'-0"

sevan

ENGINEERING

Corporate Office:

3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
Downers Grove, IL 60515

info@sevansolutions.com www.sevansolutions.com

INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY

REVISIONS

=
©

DATE | DESCRIPTION

03.19.2022|SITE PLAN REVIEW

06.30.2022| REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT

08.05.2022|REVISED PER RIDOT

08.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM

09.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

11.21.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

12.08.2022|REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE

12.13.2022|REVISED SITE PAVING

01.09.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

|| J|lOOU|B|lwW|IN|FL O

01.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
o

02.01.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

[N
[N

02.06.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

[N
No

02.14.2023|REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT

CONSULTANT

SEAL

TIMOTHY KRATZ

\ I
02/15/2023 \/

CUSTOMER

Woshoille

Your Hometown Car Wash

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

WASHVILLE CARWASH

PROJECT LOCATION

991-995 W MAIN RD
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842

(NEWPORT COUNTY)

SHEET TITLE

DIMENSION CONTROL
SITE PLAN

SHEET MANAGEMENT

PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN RI

DATE:

CRITERIA: 110" TUNNEL

PROJECT MANAGER:

THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.

REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN
PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.

(NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022

SHEET NUMBER

C1.20




SITE SPECIFIC GRADING GENERAL NOTES: GRADING NOTES: s e \/ a I l
ENGINEERING
THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR THE REPAIR OF ANY EXISTING SITE IMPROVEMENTS 1. VERIFY REQUIRED SPOT ELEVATIONS/GRADING IN THE VICINITY OF THE BUILDING WITH THE ARCHITECTURAL
THAT MAY BE DISTURBED DURING CONSTRUCTION. THIS SHALL INCLUDE, AND IS NOT NECESSARILY PLANS.
LIMITED TO:
(A) EXISTING CURB THAT MAY BE DISTURBED 2. ALL MATERIALS AND CONSTRUCTION METHODS SHALL BE IN CONFORMANCE WITH THE DRAWINGS AND
(B) EXISTING ASPHALT THAT MAY BE DISTURBED PROJECT MANUAL, AND WITH LOCAL JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY STANDARDS AND SPECIFICATIONS.
(C) EXISTING LANDSCAPING,
(D) EXISTING LIGHT STANDARD(S) AND WIRING. 3. ALL PROPOSED SPOT ELEVATIONS IN PAVED AREAS ARE TO TOP OF PAVEMENT UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE.
0 S S 0 0 0S S S 0 o) Corporate Office:
. 4. THE PROJECT SITE SHALL BE GRADED TO PROVIDE POSITIVE DRAINAGE AT ALL TIMES, ENSURING NO AREAS OF 3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
GRADING LEGEND: STANDING WATER
: Downers Grove, IL 60515
info@ lutions. 8 lutions.
8 TOP OF CAPE COD BERM 5. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL, AT HIS OR HER EXPENSE, RESTORE ANY AND ALL STRUCTURES, PIPE, UTILITY, mio@sevansolufions.com - wisevansolutions.com
16 GUTTER GRADE PAVEMENT, CURB, SIDEWALK, LANDSCAPED AREA, ETC. DISTURBED WITHIN THE SITE AND/OR ADJOINING INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY
TC TOP OF CURB PROPERTIES DURING DEMOLITION OR CONSTRUCTION. SUCH FACILITIES SHALL BE RESTORED TO THEIR ORIGINAL
T/WALL TOP OF WALL CONDITION OR BETTER, TO THE SATISFACTION OF THE AFFECTED OWNER(S). REVISIONS
B/WALL FINISHED GRADE AT BASE OF WALL NO.| DATE | DESCRIPTION
G FINISHED GRADE 6. UNDERDRAINS MAY BE ADDED, IF DETERMINED NECESSARY BY THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR AND AUTHORIZED BY '
THE OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE, AFTER SUBGRADE IS ROUGH GRADED. 0 [03.19.2022[SITE PLAN REVIEW
FL DITCH FLOW LINE
TP TOP OF PAVEMENT 1 {06.30.2022| REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT
7. UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY INDICATED HEREON, FINISHED GRADES ARE TO MATCH ADJACENT EXISTING
RIM UNDERGROUND STRUCTURE RIM GRADES. 2 |08.05.2022| REVISED PER RIDOT
W TOP OF WALK 3 |08.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM
FFE FINISHED FLOOR ELEVATION 8. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL PRESERVE EXISTING VEGETATION WHERE POSSIBLE AND/OR AS NOTED ON 4 109.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
ME MATCH EXISTING DRAWINGS. SEE SESC PLAN ON SHEET C1.11 FOR LIMIT OF DISTURBANCE. PROTECT EXISTING TREES TO REMAIN 5 111.21.2022| REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
2.0% PROPOSED SLOPE WITH TEMPORARY FENCING PLACED AT THE DRIP LINE. NO GROUND DISTURBANCE OR STORAGE OF MATERIAL = 113.08.2022] REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE
—— DIRECTION OF OVERLAND FLOW SHALL OCCUR WITHIN THE DRIP LINE LIMITS, UNLESS HEREON EXPRESSLY INDICATED OTHERWISE. O
7 [12.13.2022|REVISED SITE PAVING
9. ALL EXCAVATION IS CONSIDERED UNCLASSIFIED AND THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR ALL 8 [01.09.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
MEANS, METHODS AND MATERIALS OF CONSTRUCTION TO COMPLETE THE CONSTRUCTION PER THE DRAWINGS 9 101.23.2023 REVISED PER EASEMENT

AND PROJECT MANUAL. ADDITIONALLY, THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR THE OFF-SITE DISPOSAL

OF EXCESS OR UNSUITABLE MATERIAL, AS WELL AS THE IMPORTATION OF ANY BORROW MATERIAL NECESSARY 10 102.01.2023| REVISED PER EASEMENT
TO COMPLETE THE PROJECT. 11 [02.06.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
12 [02.14.2023|REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT

10. PER TOWNSHIP STANDARDS, ALL STORMWATER RUNOFF SHALL BE CONTAINED AND COLLECTED ON-SITE TO BE
CONVEYED UNDERGROUND TO THE EXISTING STORMWATER MANAGEMENT SYSTEM.

/ / / X . \06/ x'\ . —_— q . . -

~ g / / X\g“;b’/ —_— A)_@ rﬁ\ \ & % A CONSULTANT
S ? O _— n Q S

X%% A —_ — —_— —— o — —_ J— - X —_— = S~ E10h

ot I 103

O 102

/ /_\
/ gg/ x@@.&b ( /6102.70 | {10230 A/
X / Y
Q
N
QZW o 1 / 103 > |

s

FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Clients\Siteology\Washville\Main St Middletown R\DS\ConDocs\C1.30.dwg LAST SAVED BY: Pastrana, Osvaldo SAVED DATE: 2/15/2023 3:31 PM PLOTTED: 2/15/2023 4:03 PM

o
I \e]
" [ —
| N\ [TP 10350 | \.[TP10350 . / II\TP 103.50 S
/ TC 104.00 o TC 104.00 s Tc104.00] | [TP10295 ©
$ TP 103.50 g I T8.103.20 / —
S s TP 102.90 - A5 |
o N 2 .
§7 /éo TC104.00] (&, /TC 103.40) TP 102.90 S | S |\
¢ 4 ; o
= | TP 102.60 TIMOTHY KRATZ
l o0 [ﬂ
| T8 102.85 i
4 2d
Rir | [TP10350 | [P103501—
/ % * '\ L Jic104.00 L [1c104.00|| » :
=328 L / 5 ] W =3 / 5%
o S| (o0 < N & o ™
232 =2S S 2 3 S3l | o |
I e . o O =N ‘
< X N L
=) : CAR WASH /_ _e Ny S —
TP 104.00 / TP 104.40 / 4201 SF. E igj-gg = = e 02/15/2023 \_/
7C 104.50] /¢(TC 104.90 110' TUNNEL ' /
& A < S FFE = 104.40
N A \ CUSTOMER
o Q[b
: ERIEE A EERN
I g |28 s S 3 >
= - — — a om —
l =l B2, E 2 EE
~ ; PN [m—~ i/l
= Q ( ashville
o ° Q> »
& Sgge Your Hometown Car Wash
\ . | \[TP103.80 TP 103.80 | \
¢ & | [1C104.30 TC 104.30 ssles
2 X\ - =R
| J | \ i PROJECT DESCRIPTION
| L & SNRCACH LASH @ —OR TP 103.50 ;S s
TP 104.40> TP 104.00 | M{TP103.50 Tc10400 .8 2 s S 3
TC 10490} TC 104.50 ' \CTT = \
o 1P 103.00 | TP 103.00 \ sy EE
Jog X b . \ f: — WASHVILLE CARWASH
e x,|TP104.40 = S @ == L
[ TC 104.90 . | \
TP 103.50 S | 10350 3 TP 103.50 /d
A - ' TC 104.00 &
e R T / TC 103.50 / / | SN |
i TP 104.40) o 5 : P PROJECT LOCATION
E ) X 8 1(3 XNQRA.J % % %5 & “ - -
\ B3 83 TP 103.80 S|P 103.80 D =
Q©
S\ eol e 1€ 104.30 110430 9 ks 991-995 W MAIN RD
0, ( & =SS —
VAP \ 0 k= MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842
PROPOSED:
—~—— a \( 102 \
E.S.H.L. PLAT NO. 952 ||I° S e - ot _ - — — — STORM SEWER — SIM— (NEWPORT COUNTY)
— —l — Se= = N = N ke l ] - ROOFDRAN ~  —————=
| | | a \ e — o7 7= SHEET TITLE
s R X TR \ = SANITARY SEWER — SAN —
WATER MAIN/SERVICE —w —
RIM=103.17 S TITTIIMEET Ex , 19 100.06) MEETEX. GAS MAIN/SERVICE — GAS —
- : MEET EX[TP 100.58 TC 100.23
MEET EX[TP 103.76 TC103.30 . TC 100.75 ) ELECTRIC SERVICE UGE GRADING SITE PLAN
TC 103.93 — —
® \ TELEPHONE SERVICE — UGT —
OVERHEAD UTILITIES — OH —
‘ SHEET MANAGEMENT
RIM=103.17 WEST MAIN ROAD - ROUTE 114 '
: STORM MANHOLE TRANSFORMER PROJCTNO.. MDDLETOWN &
. (PUBLIC — VARIABLE WIDTH) JAN DATE: -
& Joc o N o \ R (=) CATCH BASIN CRITERIA: 110" TUNNEE
N K O >
\ S vee \A & - YARD BASIN EC\,\l:,l) LIGHT POLE PROJECT MANAGER:
< THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
0(0_\>< . /.\q/ . WATE R VA I_VE SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.
\ : < v 5 ] rLareD END secTioN & FRenoRNT e T st e
SAN'TARY MANHOLE (NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022
CO— SANITARY CLEANOUT
SHEET NUMBER
_ C1.30
SCALE: 1"=20'-0" 0 20 40
e e —




FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Clients\Siteology\Washville\Main St Middletown R\DS\ConDocs\C1.31.dwg LAST SAVED BY: Pastrana, Osvaldo SAVED DATE: 2/15/2023 3:07 PM PLOTTED: 2/15/2023 4:04 PM

PROPOSED: EXISTING: s e U a n
STORM STRUCTURE NOTES:
UTILITY EASEMENT NOTE: STRUCTURE TABLE
STORM SEWER — STM — S DETALLS ON SHEET C5 00 ENGINEERING
ROOEDRAN o ___ REFER TO THE BOUNDARY/TOPOGRAPHIC SURVEY PREPARED BY GPI FOR ' o NAME: DETAILS: DESCRIPTION: N E
VYA YW
—==—=——=— PROPERTYLINE EDGE OF WOODS INFORMATION REGARDING EXISTING EASEMENTS. 2. ALLSTORM STRUCTURES TO BE INSTALLED IN ACCORDANCE WITH LOCAL STANDARDS AND DETAILS
SANITARY SEWER — SAN — EDGE OF PAVEMENT [ 77707 CONCRETE UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE. MH 1 ;"ZM,\T\:/%\?%U 56.90 4 Dif]mleter Concentric Cylindrical | 301356 73 | 162412.96
—— —  EDGE OF GRAVEL — " T=99. Manhole Structure ‘ :
WATER MAIN/SERVICE w OH OVERHEAD UTILITY LINES MONITORING WELL 3. PROVIDE INLET FILTERS FOR ALL INLETS. FILTER SHALL BE REGULARLY MAINTAINED AND REMAIN IN
S SEWER LINE GRANITE OR CONCRETE MH 2 12" SEINVIN =99.36 M |<;m|e Setr otncen rctyinancat 1 3g437 83 | 162466.18 . Corporate Office: .
4. ALLSTRUCTURE FRAME AND GRATES TO BE STANDARD UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE. 12" SW INV OUT = 99.36 anhole Structure 3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
ELECTRIC SERVICE UGE G GAS LINE BOUND (GB OR CB) SEE SHEET C1.40 FOR UTILITY CROSSINGS.
Downers Grove, IL 60515
TELEPHONE SERVICE — UGT — T TEL. LINE Qs UTILITY POLE 5. NORTHING AND EASTING PER COORDINATE SYSTEM PROVIDED IN THE SURVEY AUTOCAD FILE i RIM = 102.90 4 Diameter Concentric Cylndrical | 1,00 o | 1oae o info@sevansolutions.com  www.sevansolutions.com
OVERHEAD UTILITIES oy — UG UNDERGROUND ELECT. ® SEWER MANHOLE PROVIDED BY GPI. 12" SWINVOUT=99.90 | Manhole Structure : : INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAIWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY
. ~ DOUBLE YELLOW LINE o DRAIN MANHOLE RIDOT UTILITY PERMIT NOTE:
) ) e £ LINE 6. ALL CATCH BASINS AND INLETS SHALL HAVE UNDERDRAINS INSTALLED, WRAPPED IN GEOTEXTILE RIM = 102.60 N -
PROPOSED UTILITIES BY OTHERS — SIM — : S ~ SINGLE WHITE LIN o CATCH BASIN THE OWNER OR CONTRACTOR SHALL APPLY FOR AND RECEIVE A UTILITY PERMIT AND PLACED IN THE SEWER TRENCH, NOT MORE THAN 3 FEET BELOW THE TOP OF THE CASTING, MH4 | 12" NEINVIN = 99.61 ;‘AD'met;-‘tr Cotnce””'c Cylindrical | 301535 48 | 16225219 REVISIONS
~—~ """ VERTICAL OR SLOPED GRANITE CURB FROM THE RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION BEFORE 12" NW INVOUT = 99,61 | 1annote structure NO.| DATE |DESCRIPTION
STORM MANHOLE TRANSFORMER PERFOMING ANY WORK WITHIN THE RIGHT OF WAY.
JAN iov Xy WATER SHUTOFF RIM = 101.80 . B 0 {03.19.2022|SITE PLAN REVIEW
N X IRRIGATION CONTROL VALVE wv MH 5 12" SW INV IN = 99.29 4' Diameter Concentric Cylindrical 384138.93 | 16230147
a CATCH BASIN . % WATER VALVE \ - Manhole Structure : : 1 {06.30.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT
Oﬂ: LIGHT POLE GV 15" NE INV OUT =99.29
YARD BASIN \ % GAS SHUTOFF 2 [08.05.2022[REVISED PER RIDOT
W) WATER VALVE RIM = 101.16: 4" Brick/Solid Block 40" Diameter 3 08.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM
IEQ FLARED END SECTION MH 6 12" N INV IN = 96.87 Round Manhole (R.I. Standard 384128.80 | 162397.32 bl
o  FIREHYDRANT EX. 12"INV=06.65¢ | 3.2.0). See Detall 7/C5.03. 4 [09.29.2022| REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
SANITARY MANHOLE TR T —y " L1 EVEDFER TOWN EVEW
— SANITARY CLEANOUT 8" NE INVIN =100.83 Outlet Control Structure; Deep Ve,
oe #NEINVIN=9700 | Sump Cotch B3 with overfow 38414398 | 16237122 7 112.13.2022{ REVISED SITE PAVING
=97. riser and 3.0" diameter restrictor 8 101.09.2023[REVISED PER EASEMENT
LEG EN D RIM = 103.00 Contech Cascade Separator Model 9 (01.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
CCs1 12" NEINVIN =99.13 CS-4 with Solid Lid Frame and 384210.81 | 162425.89 10 [02.01.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
8" SWINV OUT =99.00 Cover; See Detail on Sheet C1.32 11 102.06.2023REVISED PER EASEMENT
12 {02.14.2023|REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT
RIM =103.00 Contech Cascade Separator Model
CCs 2 15" SWINVIN=99.06 | CS-4 with Solid Lid Frame and 384178.43 | 162369.04
8" NEINVOUT=99.00 | Cover; See Detail on Sheet C1.32
i
. CONSULTANT
N B S == = 3 I I N .
ﬁ im_*— X—__————wg —q-qi X 1
AREA MH 1 AREA MH 3 I | [AREAMH4 I
0.192£ AC I 0.12+ AC 0.108+ AC PRECAST REINFORCED CONCRETE RIM=103.75
C=0.69 I C=0.73 I C=0.73 I | FLAT TOP (ASTM C-478)
I : I \ A . -
%-r |+ %* -,.::‘-l i _i-.i»::_‘:.
N I | I e 4 5 _— CONCRETE
Iy oy ] X BAFFLE WALL
6=E 1) IEE s SEAL
MH 3] == MH 4 _ INFLOW SEWER .~: s /—STEPS (TYP)
' (,%/ LS 7 LS I_ LS / I 8" INVIN = 100.83 g % (z
| & ¢ o2
=) I I CORE 12.0" DIA. RESTRICTOR o FLOW —= ] : — " TIMOTHY KRATZ
108 LF - 12" HDPE 85 LF - 12" HDPE . HOLE IN CONCRETE BAFFLE WALL 6'DIA. o]
PIPE @ 0.50% ! INVERT = 99.60
: I PIPE @ 0.34% SVO 1 f SvO z | I =
T/PIPE=99.50 ; -,
iDﬂ 15N BN ———|3IN — i-)ﬂ ) I PLACE UNGLUED CAP AT : of
TOP OF STANDPIPE " 'Z
\>> I 6" PVC STANDPIPE SYSTEM WITH A MIN. OF 32 3’
~ ~, E % l EACH, 1/2" DIA. HOLES DRILLED EQUALLY SPACEDJ;; }‘6" = e
[ CARWASH .| & —F
AREA BLDG 2 201 S.F. AREA BLDG 1 I < A Me— =R [Flow —=) A 02/15/2023 \ _/
0.05:AC | TUNNEL 0.05+ AC © | ¥ T |
C=0.95 =104.40 I C=0.95 I 106 LF - 12" HDPE INFLOW SEWER ;--_.. 3 £
PIPE @ 0.30% g AulNVNzwloo/'i sl asisuvp ) CUSTOMER
E I ;" 8"
v 3 | CLEAN OUT r
| ﬂ — 2 I | 6%6"%6" A
O | PVC TEE A f =
y/\,/f\//\/\/\//\/\/\//\/\/\/ °
AREA MH 5 w I h II
| — (U] 3.0" DIA. RESTRICTOR PVC PIPE
\ 0.123+ AC s o INVERT = 97.00 as ”’ e
I AREA CDS 2 =08 Gl 3 I Your Hometown Car Wash
0.110+ AC I < |
I I C=0.95 O I .
xRN
S r l o) : S PROJECT DESCRIPTION
— OUTFLOW SEWER
® < 1 @ I A\ A VAR ) U | é '%D l 12" INV OUT = 97.00
AREA CDS 1 L n
O-éogig QC = o) NVS NVS N st O S |
=U. R (SN PN 8" PVC T
\ NLS b 1S _<%> LS IS LS| = IS 4 AL wl gl ] Nrtowsewes WASHVILLE CARWASH
g —— || 1 l = 77 _ ol o | !
A5 LF - 12" HDPE 67 LF - 15 HDPE §7 - (%) 6" PVC STANDPIPE SYSTEM WITH
. ‘ PIPE @ 0.34% l é A MIN. OF 32 EACH, 1/2" DIA.
PIPE @ 0.50% R | | O | | o L I HOLES DRILLED EQUALLY SPACED SECTION A-A
vy ] ] N ‘ - T = PROJECT LOCATION
INSPECTION PORT | - |
TYP. OF 21 — o || o ” ol o ”) ollo /”3 ol o v ol o Wo ol o Vo ollo = Ok@
£ i | < ” |
VLS LS AL L s L=l s 95 l 5 1 OUTLET CONTROL STRUCTURE DETAIL 991-995 W MAIN RD
< " Mo
- ~ ) acs D = | C131  SCALE: NONE MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842
T SUBSURFACE SAND FILTER (SF-1) 8" PVC \
g WATER QUALITY STORAGE SYSTEM 25 FEFPE 1@% 0H5DoF:>/E = ‘ _ AL
63 - ASD SC-740 CHAMBERS .50% &5 <
E.S.H.L. PLAT NO. 952 ~ 2 N 2
= — = i ~— — — VOLUMEPROVIDED=5254CF = — = = — — j — =+ — < — 2l = = = = (NEWPORT COUNTY)
/[_]_, SEE DETAIL ON SHEET C1.32 —» S l MH6 | 5 \
: — — | —— IS —— WIS INLS INLS INLS N SHEET TITLE
S — NS ——— ALS ——— ALS ——— ALS |/ — ANLS —— WIS WIS — — WIS INIS INIS NLS NLS N INLS IE (
ALS ——— Wis ——— W [ sv9 — Sy9 ——— SvO SV SV SV VO ) Sv9) ) ) ) SV
Sy9 ——— SV9 ——— SVO Sy9o ———— V9 ——— SVO pa
SV ov2 R RIM=103.17 LATITUDE = 41.528721 %
_ LONGITUDE =-71.295021 L STORM WATER
APPROXIMATE LOCATION OF ;
SEWER LINE PER GIS
SN — sy S N\~ |-~ — s \SAN o —SANE - = = = — = — MANAGEMENT PLAN
- V\II \/\II \/\II V\II \/\II \/\II V\II \/\Il \/\II V\II \]I / \/\II T \/\II
' SHEET MANAGEMENT
RIM=103.17 WEST MAIN ROAD - ROUTE 1 14 APPRO;(V\AMTAETRE LL‘SEATP\SRN é}g | PROJECT NO - VIDDLETOWN R
(PUBLIC — VARIABLE WIDTH) RECORDS Y-
f \ CRITERIA: 110' TUNNEL
' ! PROJECT MANAGER:
@J_— — —- — — , \ . \A T VAN MULTLSIE SOLUTIONS, e
Q % REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN
EXlSTlNG FRAME AND GRATE TO BE REPLACED WlTH PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.
A 4-FLANGE HEAVY DUTY FRAME AND GRATE. R ot s e oo s
STANDARD 6.3.4 - HIGH CAPACITY FRAME AND GRATE ’ —
(BICYCLE SAFE) WITH A 4TH FLANGE SHALL BE USED. - SHEET NUMBER
SCALE: 1"=20-0" 0 20 40
e e —




sevan

FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Clients\Siteology\Washville\Main St Middletown R\DS\ConDocs\C1.32.dwg LAST SAVED BY: Pastrana, Osvaldo SAVED DATE: 2/15/2023 2:39 PM PLOTTED: 2/15/2023 4:04 PM

FINISHED GRADE ENGINEERING
il EL="8" (MIN) CASCADE SEPARATOR DESIGN NOTES
DETAIL ON SHEET 3/4" WASHED CRUSHED STONE
C1.31 ADS SC-740 CHAMBERS THE STANDARD CS-4 CONFIGURATION IS SHOWN. ALTERNATE CONFIGURATIONS ARE AVAILABLE AND ARE LISTED BELOW. SOME CONFIGURATIONS
: 4 0Z NON-WOVEN FILTER FABRIC 95% ("A") MAY BE COMBINED TO SUIT SITE REQUIREMENTS.
- i (]
ARGUND STONE COMPACTED A (SEE FRAME AND COVER
FiLL S CONFIGURATION DESCRIPTION
A ‘ Y
3 j 3" SOLID PVC 6" MIN. (’ —— \ Y 7_“ "\ L A GRATED INLET ONLY (NO INLET PIPE) Corporate Office:
oUTu:?T\ﬁEFE?\é\(I) 83 _‘_7«1 GRATED INLET WITH INLET PIPE OR PIPES 3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
T Downers Grove, IL 60515
! TOP OF CHAMBERS FLOW CURB INLET ONLY (NO INLET PIPE) info@sevansolutions.com  www.sevansolutions.com
% ? ' EL="C" CURB INLET WITH INLET PIPE OR PIPES INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY
" %{‘:\/4\ REVISIONS
SOLID PVC PIPE i >§§\\\ EET:TSM (EF CHAMBERS 48" [1219] 1.D. MANHOLE SITE SPECIFIC NO.| DATE | DESCRIPTION
INV. ="G" N 12 [NLET PIPES) STRUCTURE DATA REQUIREMENTS 0 {03.19.2022|SITE PLAN REVIEW
23 12 ASTM C-33 SAND A TR i T e — 1 |06.30.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT
CIs S
i BOTTOM OF SAND PEAK FLOW RATE (cfs [L/s]) 2 |08.05.2022|REVISED PER RIDOT
% —_— ? o O O O O 0O © EL="F RETURN PERIOD OF PEAK FLOW (yrs) 3 108.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM
7 — PL,\%'}I T\’JEZXLIBE'B RIM ELEVATION 4 109.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
4 = ¥ : BOTTOM OF STONE PIPE DATA: INVERT MATERIAL | DIAMETER
=
R R R R R \\g R EL = "1t PEE DA 5 [11.21.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
4 07, NONWOVEN FILTER —1 VAR, \%2\ INLET PIPE 2 6 [12.08.2022|REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE
FABRIC AROUND SAND 1 OUTLET PIPE 7 112.13.2022(REVISED SITE PAVING
MEDIA CELL CONTRACTOR TO GROUT
— | — FERFORATED FVCPIFE— —— — APPROXIMATE SEASONAL TO FINISHED GRADE NOTES 7SPECIAL REQUIREMENTS: 8 |01.09.2023]REVISED PER EASEMENT
4 OZ. NON-WOVEN FILTER FABRIC = HIGH GROUNDWATER TABLE GRADE ] 1 S 9 101.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
ELEVATION = 95.40 RINGS/RISERS SIS
" " = . ) T 7 1 / _ VAZ
?)UF;-\KCE?EBT\}LNJF AROQUND STONE UNDERDRAIN MEDIA CELL 3/4" WASHED.CRUSHED STONE \| 1 : } \\/ 10 102.01.2023| REVISED PER EASEMENT
STRUCTURE 30 MIL POLYLINER — l e FRﬁm“EEﬁE":R/&IOEgER 11 |02.06.2023]REVISED PER EASEMENT
TOP OF CENTER CHAMBER ’ . ; ( NOT TO SCALE ) 12 02142023 REVlSED PER FENCE HElGHT
NOTE: EXCAVATIONS FOR SYSTEMS MUST BE LINED WITH A 30 MIL (EXTENS'OXS Qgg&g‘g T
POLYLINER TO PREVENT [INTERACTION WITH GROUNDWATER F ) ‘ @ —l
o
<
INLET PIPE \ =
, B (MULTIPLE INLET PIPES ' OUTLET PIPE B
NUMBER  FINISHED TOPOF  CHAMBER BOTTOMOF BOTTOMOF UNDERDRAIN BOTTOM MAY BE ACCOMMODATED) | f | -]
SYSTEM ID OF UNITS GRADE CHAMBERS INLETS CHAMBERS SAND INVERT OF STONE —y ] g F— - —
IIAII “Bn "C" IIDII NEII IIFII HGII IIH!I 52.
! 2 GENERAL NOTES
>F 63 VARIES 101.00 99.00 99.00 97:50 97.00 96.67 12 I?gg QIE‘I'CEHSTF%CP):T:IOC\Z/ :ZI)DRI’EA/\\/:/_II;\I'\C/-I-Q-I\—/EIR'}IQ IIDSEL'I{EIII__EESDSSNI'ORLEC?I'L?;EH EDTA\;I\IIElzgiONS AND WEIGHT, PLEASE CONTACT YOUR CONTECH ENGINEERED
SEE SHEET C1.30 =]~ I == Y | " SOLUTIONS LLC REPRESENTATIVE. www.ContechES.com ’ CONSULTANT
: |- 3. CASCADE SEPARATOR WATER QUALITY STRUCTURE SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH ALL DESIGN DATA AND INFORMATION CONTAINED IN
PERMANENT / THIS DRAWING. CONTRACTOR TO CONFIRM STRUCTURE MEETS REQUIREMENTS OF PROJECT.
POOL ELEVATION . .o 4. CASCADE SEPARATOR STRUCTURE SHALL MEET AASHTO HS20 LOAD RATING, ASSUMING EARTH COVER OF 0' - 2' [610], AND GROUNDWATER
: g L[] .y ELEVATION AT, OR BELOW, THE OUTLET PIPE INVERT ELEVATION. ENGINEER OF RECORD TO CONFIRM ACTUAL GROUNDWATER ELEVATION.
g . ) CASTINGS SHALL MEET AASHTO M306 AND BE CAST WITH THE CONTECH LOGO.
TYPICAL SUBSURFACE SAND FILTER SECTION FIBERGLASS INTERNAL / ' | il 5. CASCADE SEPARATOR STRUCTURE SHALL BE PRECAST CONCRETE CONFORMING TO ASTM C478 AND AASHTO LOAD FACTOR DESIGN
: METHOD.
SCALE: NOT TO SCALE COMPONENTS /5 g 6. ALTERNATE UNITS ARE SHOWN IN MILLIMETERS [mm ].
; INSTALLATION NOTES
: A. ANY SUB-BASE, BACKFILL DEPTH, AND/OR ANTI-FLOTATION PROVISIONS ARE SITE-SPECIFIC DESIGN CONSIDERATIONS AND SHALL BE
SOLIDS STORAGE SUMP / -~ SPECIFIED BY ENGINEER OF RECORD.
. Tt B. CONTRACTOR TO PROVIDE EQUIPMENT WITH SUFFICIENT LIFTING AND REACH CAPACITY TO LIFT AND SET THE CASCADE SEPARATOR
- - — MANHOLE STRUCTURE.
DROOFOFE C. CONTRACTOR TO INSTALL JOINT SEALANT BETWEEN ALL STRUCTURE SECTIONS AND ASSEMBLE STRUCTURE. SEAL
7 D. CONTRACTOR TO PROVIDE, INSTALL, AND GROUT INLET AND OUTLET PIPE(S). MATCH PIPE INVERTS WITH ELEVATIONS SHOWN. ALL PIPE
CENTERLINES TO MATCH PIPE OPENING CENTERLINES.
ELEVATION A-A E. CONTRACTOR TO TAKE APPROPRIATE MEASURES TO ASSURE UNIT IS WATER TIGHT, HOLDING WATER TO FLOWLINE INVERT MINIMUM. IT IS
NOT TO SCALE SUGGESTED THAT ALL JOINTS BELOW PIPE INVERTS ARE GROUTED. TIMOTHY KRATZ
VA ®
CASCADE CNTECH s
ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS LLC CASCADE SEPARATOR
.contechES.
separator"‘ 9025 Genire Pointe Dr. Suite 400, West Ghester, OH 45069 STANDARD DETAIL
800-338-1122 513-645-7000 513-645-7993 FAX

\ /
02/15/2023 \/

CUSTOMER

asl;bille

Your Hometown Car Wash

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

WASHVILLE CARWASH

PROJECT LOCATION

991-995 W MAIN RD
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842

(NEWPORT COUNTY)

SHEET TITLE

SAND FILTER AND CDS
DETAILS

SHEET MANAGEMENT

PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN RI
DATE: -
CRITERIA: 110" TUNNEL
PROJECT MANAGER: -

THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.

REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN
PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.

(NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022

SHEET NUMBER

C1.32




FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Clients\Siteology\Washville\Main St Middletown R\DS\ConDocs\C1.40.dwg LAST SAVED BY: Pastrana, Osvaldo SAVED DATE: 2/15/2023 3:20 PM PLOTTED: 2/15/2023 4:05 PM

PROPOSED: EXISTING:
NOTE: (") {x) PROPOSED UTILITY KEYED NOTES Seyaon
STORM SEWER — STM — —
ROOFDRAN o ____ SANITARY CONNECTION INVERT BASED ON MINIMUM SLOPE. GC TO VERIFY EXISTING SANITARY 1 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICE. ENGINEERING
——=e——ae—e—  PROPERTY LINE OO EDGE OF WOODS LEAD INVERT DURING CONSTRUCTION AND NOTIFY OWNER'S CONSTRUCTION REPRESENTATIVE OF
SANITARY SEWER —— SAN — EDGE OF PAVEMENT T T CONGRETE ANY DISCREPANCIES. 2 NATURAL GAS SERVICE.
WATER MAIN/SERVICE W EDGE OF GRAVEL e 3 GENERAL CONTRACTOR TO PROVIDE AND INSTALL TRANSFORMER PAD PER SERVICE
/ OH OVERHEAD UTILITY LINES MONITORING WELL UTILITY EASEMENT NOTE: PROVIDER SPECIFICATIONS RELATING TO LOCATION CONDUIT STUB-UP LOCATIONS,
GAS MAIN/SERVICE GAS b DRAINAGE LINE o) IRON PIPE OR REBAR PAD SIZE AND OBSTRUCTION CLEARANCE.
N ek s SEWER LINE - GRANITE OR CONCRETE REFER TO THE BOUNDARY/TOPOGRAPHIC SURVEY PREPARED BY GPI FOR INFORMATION 4 ELECTRIC SERVICE
— — G AS LINE REGARDING EXISTING EASEMENTS. o
GAS BOUND (GB OR C8) 5 SITE LIGHT. SEE ARCHITECTURAL SHEETS AND SITE ELECTRICAL PLAN FOR CIRCUITING 3025 Hi hla;JP;rﬁf\;la Suite 850
TELEPHONE SERVICE —— UGT — T TEL. LINE Sol UTILITY POLE AND LIGHT POLE BASE DETAILS. SEE SITE PHOTOMETRIC PLAN. & v,
UG UNDERGROUND ELECT. ® SEWER MANHOLE Downers Grove, IL 60515
J— R . 6 info@sevansolutions.com www.sevansolutions.com
OVERHEAD UTILITIES OH o  DOUBLE YELLOW LINE o DRAIN MANHOLE DRY UTILITY NOTE: STORM SEWER. SEE SHEET C1.31 FOR PIPE DIAMETER AND SLOPE.
r— — s 7 WATER RECLAMATION SYSTEM. SEE ARCHITECTURAL AND PLUMBING PLANS. RIM INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY
PROPOSED UTILITIES BY OTHERS ST™ - - SINGLE WHITE LINE - CATCH BASIN THE ROUTING FOR TELECOMMUNICATIONS, NATURAL GAS, AND ELECTRIC, IF SHOWN, IS FOR ELEVATION OF ALL RISERS = 103.50
/S0 9% SSC VERTICALORSLOPED GRANITECURB 9% HYDRANT SCHEMATIC PURPOSES ONLY. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL CONTACT THE INDIVIDUAL UTILITY REVISIONS
STORM MANHOLE JAN TRANSFORMER o 21 WATER SHUTOFF COMPANIES TO DETERMINE ACTUAL ROUTE FOR SERVICING THE BUILDING AND COORDINATE 8  SAMPLE BOX. SEE ARCHITECTURAL AND PLUMBING PLANS.
7N %4 IRRIGATION CONTROL VALVE THEIR CONSTRUCTION NO.| DATE | DESCRIPTION
a CATCH BASIN X WATER VALVE ' 9 SAND/OIL SEPARATOR. SEE ARCHITECTURAL AND PLUMBING PLANS.
ol LIGHT POLE o CAS SHUTOFT 0 {03.19.2022{SITE PLAN REVIEW
S @ > O ROVIDE 18" CLEARANCE AT ALL UTIIY CROSSINGS, MAKE CONNECTION 20 EXSTING. | -|P5302002/REVSED PR IDEM AND ROT
WATER VALVE :
e FLARED END SECTION SERVICE LEAD PER MUNICIPAL STANDARDS. 2 [08.05.2022| REVISED PER RIDOT
* FIRE HYDRANT 11 SUBSURFACE SAND FILTER SYSTEM. SEE SHEET C1.32 FOR DETAILS 3 (082520221 REVISED PER RIDEM
SANITARY MANHOLE ' ' ' 4 109.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
CO— SANITARY CLEANOUT 12 WATER RECLAMATION SYSTEM PIPING. SEE ARCHITECTURAL AND PLUMBING PLANS. 5 111212022 REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
6 [12.08.2022|REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE
LEGEND 7 [12.13.2022| REVISED SITE PAVING
8 {01.09.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
9 {01.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
10 |02.01.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
AP 106 LOT 142
/o KELLY & PICERNE 12 |02.14.2023|REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT
75 LAMBERT LIND HIGHWAY
WARWICK, RI 02886
BOOK 101 PAGE 60
#969 WEST MAIN ROAD
i
. CONSULTANT
ﬁ lgx — — _— - _— o ——— —_ o — o e— X X X PR—
|
|
PRIVATE RIGHT OF
WAY PER PLAN
) REFERENCE #1
40 WIDE PRIVATE
RIGHT OF WAY PER\ l HOOK 589 FAGE 14
PLAN REFERENCE #1 | @ |
0 o=>E- ) | SEAL
= INLLS L LS e— LS LS
= ¥ . AP 106 LOT 117
| 8 o 1) N/F PLAZA ASSOCIATES, LLC TIMOTHY KRATZ
- — U i c/o DAVID BAZARSKY
l 678 AQUIDNECK AVENUE
= S \&; S MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842
. e s \\ \& BOOK 1063 PAGE 240
Al A 39N 39N 39N 39N ———|39N ——— 395N ——— 39N 39N ) @ #957 WEST MAIN ROAD
. . . ‘
p 9
I = s| 1™ |
| SAN AT BUILDING CAR\VASH 5 —
INV 98.55 2201SF. | 4 02/15/2023 \ _/
| N\ O
AP 106 LOT 114 110" TUNNEL :
N/F KENNETH J. ALVES e~ " ] FFE = 104.40 | /
PO BOX 4360 /\ " DIAEAl\éTHEg o CUSTOMER
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842 RIM=103.25 | > \/ERHDA ‘
BOOK 429 PAGE 249 = . | = /
| INV IN=98.21 34 LF-6" PVC SDR-35 ' N Lot Ln\
999 WEST MAIN ROAD 1 R N 2 < | -
# | INV OUT=98.21 SAN PIPE @1.00% O ' | =
@
(W]
— TN | ashville
\ Bl 8 Your Hometown Car Wash
; /
| 137 LF-6" PVC SDR-35 I © /
0,
| \\ & SAN PIPE @1'0&" o PROJECT DESCRIPTION
(@) EXI \ IR
EXIT ONLY TONLY =EERT /
7 —ll Tle
— NS NVS O 5 /
| 1 N | WASHVILLE CARWASH
% W B GD
l <ZE = o I
(V]
<C
s (o) | Lw
D = I PROJECT LOCATION
\ ) = |
)
\ N | 991-995 W MAIN RD
S | MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842
4' DIAMETER
> RIM=102.40 ~
E.S.H.L. PLAT NO. 952 ~ ~ G INV IN=36.84 ‘ ff(’ 4 /
2L A . —_— — — I S — e e H INV OUT=06 84 sl —————F——5 | _——— ESHL PATNe. 92 000 00 (NEWPORT COUNTY)
$5o l et /
— 1L - : — s s
LS ALS —— WIS ——— WIS |——— WIS —— WIS — HIALS INIS WIS IS WIS LS WIFD——— WIS LS — WIS LS LS LS LS SHEET TITLE
ALs s e AL YO ———— SVO &Yy9 ———— S¥VD ———— VO ——— SVO SY9 SV9 VO ——— S¥YO ——— SVO Sve, SV9 SVY9 SV9 SY9 SV9 /
SY9 ———— Y9 ———— YO —— VD ———— VO~ V9 T 3 84 LF-6" PVC SDR-35
OVERHEAD OPEN CUT REMOVE AND REPLACE EX. PAVEMENT SAN PIPE @1.00% /
L eeROXATE LoCATION OF WIRES (TYP.) AS REQUIRED TO INSTALL WATER SERVICE UTILITY PLAN
SEWER LINE PER GIS ; ’ _ JR— — —_— - - - SAN - ’_’ T
- - - - — — _SAN— - - - - - — - — — —SAN— RECORDS - — — — —SAN— — - - — — —SAN- - - - — — — —-—SMWN— — — — — — — — — — —S5AN— — — — R —
O — — — — — — — — S —— e e e = = = = e e\ = = = = = = == = = == — { OPEN CUT REMOVE AND REPLACE EX. PAVEMENT — —  —  —
AS REQUIRED TO INSTALL SANITARY SEWER W
W W W W OVERHEAD W W W W W I \ " \ " W W "
TYP. .
o WEST MAIN ROAD - ROUTE 114 / DL CoECToN ToEx L
. = APPROXIMATE LOCAJION OF .
(PUBLIC — VARIABLE WIDTH) JMATE LoCATION OF SANITARY SEWER PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN RI
-_— RECORDS . -
( PRESSURE CONNECTION CONTRACTOR TO FIELD VERIFY DEPTH OF EXISTING SANITARY SEWER AND NOTIFY ENGINEER Zalls .
| n TO EX. WATER OF ANY DISCREPANCIES THAT WOULD PROHIBIT CONSTRUCTION OF SEWER SERVICE TO THE CRITERIA 110 TUNNER
' DESIGNED DEPTHS PRIOR TO ORDERING MATERIALS OR BEGINNING SEWER CONSTRUCTION PROJECT MANAGER: -
\\ & THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
Q Q SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.
% REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN
PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.
(NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022
SHEET NUMBER
SCALE: 1"=20-0" 0 20 40
e ey —




FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Ciizms\Stte g \Maativika\aarc stitid tHetomRRD S Cob B S E D00 gy ANST/SAIE BB P i ren ) Dalcidd SASAVEDADAT B/ 33 172021228 28P R OLOHDE R/ 15/15) 20 2305.05/PM

L O
S
S crosssecrion
CONCRETE
WASHOUT
AREA
3'X3
SIGN
NOTES:

1. ACTUAL LAYOUT AND SIGN PLACEMENT TO BE DETERMINED IN THE FIELD.

DIRECT CONCRETE A
WASHOUT WATER INTO W —— = ‘“O/\N
FILTER RING

C—/cCc—/—

—/acCc—
24" DIAMETER COMPOST —
FILTER SOCK: 4' MIN. ——— WOOD FRAME
OVERLAP ON UPSLOPE ——
SIDE OF FILTER RING —
CONCRETE oo TRRE = - f
WASHOUT WATER 50/&' - - A - ‘%

NOT TO EXCEED 50%
OF BARRIER HEIGHT

2" X 2"X16" WOOD

STAKES PLACED AT
5"0.C.

24" DIAMETER

PLAN VIEW

ATTACH FILTER FABRIC
SECURELY TO 2X4 WOOD
FRAME, OVERLAPPING FABRIC
TO NEXT STAKE

TOP FRAME NECESSARY
/ FOR STABILITY
GEED GEED CTGEED T

COMPOST FILTER ! il < "‘o"'{ : o

SOCK 18" MAX 36" W@%& X4 WOOD FRAME
S S (100X50) 4 SIDES OF D.I.

INSTALL SUITABLE M’g@%ﬁgﬁﬁ;ﬁﬁ;&

IMPERVIOUS R I%

GEOMEMBRANE ON & DROP INLE

A FLAT GRADE ) \

2. MATERIALS USED TO CONSTRUCT TEMPORARY CONCRETE WASHOUT FACILITIES SHALL BE REMOVED
FROM THE SITE OF THE WORK AND DISPOSED OF OR RECYCLED.

3. HOLES, DEPRESSIONS OR OTHER GROUND DISTURBANCE CAUSED BY THE REMOVAL OF THE
TEMPORARY CONCRETE WASHOUT FACILITIES SHALL BE BACKFILLED, REPAIRED, AND STABILIZED TO
PREVENT EROSION.

CONCRETE WASH DETAIL

C5.00 SCALE: NONE

()
NG

STRAW
WATTLE

\\///i%‘b/\ VNN
LA

WATTLE CROSS SECTION
ON BARE SOIL

NOTES:

WOOD STAKE

2" DEEP TRENCH
(TYP)

EROSION I

STRAW
WATTLE

CONTROL ; ;
et AR

/

OO

SRIN,
NN 48
WATTLE CROSS SECTION
ON EROSION CONTROL

1. ENDS OF WATTLES SHALL BE TURNED SLIGHTLY UP SLOPE.
2. RECOMMENDED STAKES ARE 1 1/8" WIDE X 1 1/8" THICK X 30" LONG.
3. STAKES SHALL NOT EXTEND ABOVE STRAW WATTLE MARE THAN 2".

BLANKET

NOTES:

1.

SECTION A-A

DROP INLET SEDIMENT BARRIERS ARE TO BE USED FOR SMALL, NEARLY LEVEL DRAINAGE AREAS.

LESS THAN 5%
( )

USE 2"X4" WOOD OR EQUIVALENT METAL STAKES, 3' (1M) MINIMUM LENGTH.

INSTALL 2"X4" WOOD TOP FRAME TO INSURE STABILITY.

THE TOP OF THE FRAME (PONDING HEIGHT) MUST BE WELL BELOW THE GROUND ELEVATION
DOWNSLOPE TO PREVENT RUNOFF FROM BY- PASSING THE INLET. A TEMPORARY DIKE MAY BE
NECESSARY ON THE DOWNSLOPE SIDE OF THE STRUCTURE.

SILT FENCE INLET FILTER

C5.00

()
&/

PROTECTED AREA

AREA OF DISTURBANCE

/—LIMIT OF CLEARING

(LOCATION AS
DETAILED ON PLANS)

HORIZONTAL BALED HAY OR STRAW STAKED IN
BALE BINDING PLACE WITH (2) 1"x1"x3'=0" (MIN.) STAKES
EXISTING
HIGHWAY
GROUND SLOPE
oy ] ‘_3 \ ‘
SIS R SAS ENSINN
» ”l
=0 ELEVATION

SCALE: NONE

ORI :
XX R XXX
| 009090904 9999999 000909999 VOLI00999;
AR RN RN

FENCE LOCATION AT

CRITICAL ROOT L CRITICAL ROOT ZONE LIMITS

ZONE (RADIUS = 12"
PER 1" OF TRUNK
DIAMETER)

DRIPLINE OF TREE
(VARIES)

(RADIUS = 12" PER 1" OF
TRUNK DIAMETER)

Vroozszozzz)
ZZZZZZTZZ.

Y T |

SNOW FENCE OR CHAIN
LINK FENCE WITH POST

AT 6'-0" MAXIMUM O.C. \

= b— LIFTING
~ et STRAPS
DRIPLINE OF TREE
(VARIES)
SNOW FENCE OR CHAIN \_U_I < IJU_ o
LINK FENCE WITH POST e K PRI
A e O M AYIMUM B.C. EP e DANDY BAG —— GRATING SR
BER INLET SECTION
INSTALLATION:

TREE PROTECTION FENCING

STAND GRATE ON END. PLACE DANDY BAG OVER GRATE. ROLL GRATE OVER SO THAT OPEN END IS UP.
PULL UP SLACK. TUCK FLAP IN. BE SURE END OF GRATE IS COMPLETELY COVERED BY FLAP OR DANDY
BAG WILL NOT FIT PROPERLY. HOLDING HANDLES, CAREFULLY PLACE DANDY BAG WITH GRATE
INSERTED INTO CATCH BASIN FRAME SO THAT RED DOT ON THE TOP OF THE DANDY BAG IS VISIBLE.

MAINTENANCE:

WITH A STIFF BRISTLE BROOM OR SQUARE POINT SHOVEL REMOVE SILT & OTHER DEB
AFTER EACH EVENT.

PRE-MANUFACTURED

RIS OFF SURFACE

C5.00 SCALE: NONE

A
&/

C5.00 SCALE: NONE

/> INLET PROTECTION DETAILS
NG

e o

PROTECTED AREA AREA OF DISTURBANCE

/—UMIT OF CLEARING

METAL CONNECTOR
CABLE 1/8" @ (MIN.)

2"x2"x4’—-6"(MAX.) —
OAK POST

DRIVE IN TRENCH
(SEE NOTE 2)

SUPPORT NETTING
(HEAVY DUTY
PLASTIC MESH) ~

(MIN.)

2'-6"

-

HEAVY-DUTY CORD SEWN IN SILT
FENCE FABRIC QTOP AND BOTTOM)
(SEE DETAIL "A® FOR TOP CORD TO
EVERY OTHER SILT FENCE POST)

/ FILTER FABRIC

COMPACTED BACKFILL
IN TRENCH

NOTE
SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 211 OF THE R.l. STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS.

CRUSHED STONE

sevan

ENGINEERING

Corporate Office:

3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
Downers Grove, IL 60515

info@sevansolutions.com www.sevansolutions.com

INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY

REVISIONS

=
©

DATE | DESCRIPTION

03.03.2022|SITE PLAN REVIEW

06.30.2022| REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT

08.05.2022|REVISED PER RIDOT

08.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM

09.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

11.21.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

12.08.2022(REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE

12.13.2022|REVISED SITE PAVING

01.09.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

[Noll el BN o)l O, i BN OO I O N Y K=

01.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
o

02.01.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
[N

02.06.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
No

02.14.2023|REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT

CONSULTANT

SEAL

5" MIN.

GEOGRID

REQUIRED

CATCH BASIN
WITH GRATE

TIMOTHY KRATZ

\ I
02/15/2023 \/

CUSTOMER

i i {
N SRR

2 ) RN mu

2) 1"x1"x3'~-0"

2) ; N
STAKES PER BALE

HORIZONTAL BALE

BINDING (TYP.) \

COMPACTED SOIL
TO PREVENT PIPING

SUBGRADE

NOTES:

ashville

Your Hometown Car Wash

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

BALED HAY OR STRAW
STAKED IN PLACE

WASHVILLE CARWASH

PROJECT LOCATION

991-995 W MAIN RD
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842

(NEWPORT COUNTY)

SHEET TITLE

RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

y A7
CHIpJ ENGINEER 4“
%m;m

CHIEF DESIGN ENGINEER
TRANSPORTATION

JUNE 15, 1998

ISSUE DATE

/—LIMIT OF CLEARING FINISH GRADE
EXISTING GRADE
PROTECTED AREA | AREA OF DISTURBANCE \ /
(LOCATION AS — s ,
DETAILED ON PLANS) I AR ; : S
(2) 1”x1"x3'=0" (MIN.) i
STAKES PER BALE . | .
BALES TO ki \ 6" MIN
BUTT TOGETHER WEDGE LOOSE HAY BETWEEN ~ BURY FLAP OF FILTER FABRIC
BALES TO MAKE A CONTINUOUS IN BOTTOM OF TRENCH
BARRIER (TYP.)
1'—6"(MIN.) SILT FENCE
- [} v POST
&' NOTES: 1'—0" MIN. z
#A| 1. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH NOTES:
H B opcoon, 00 OF THE R.. STANDARD 1. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 206 OF THE R.l.
° ol 2 70 B oS WHERE THE EXISTIN STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS.
- & & G 2. 2"x2"x4'—6"(MAX.) OAK POSTS FOR SILT FENCE SHALL BE '
(= GROUND SLOPES AWAY FROM THE 4 o | || —SUT FABRIC
S FIGWAY EMBANKMENT Ao T LOCATED 8'—0" (MAX.) O.C. IN WETLAND AREAS AND 40" | <~ AND LOOP
Pon N PLANG (MAX.) O.C. IN WETLAND RAVINE, GULLY OR DROP—OFF Z 1 L1 case
] 3. AT APPROXIMATE 100'—0" INTERVALS AREAS AS SHOWN ON PLANS. |11 ovRpesT
: 3. 1"x1"x4'—6" (MIN.) POSTS PERMITTED FOR PRE—FABRICATED |
A BALE OF HAY IS TO BUTT SILT FENCE
PERPENDICULARLY. 4. SILT FENCE SHALL BE INSTALLED BEFORE ANY GRUBBING SILT FENCE FABRIC
PLAN OR EARTH EXCAVATION TAKES PLACE. DETAIL "A”
RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
REVISIONS REVISIONS
No.| BY | DATE BALED HAY EROSION CHECK No.| By | DT SILT FENCE DETAIL

CHIEF DESIGN ENGINEER

TRANSPORTATION

/(4“1
cHpf ENGINEER o
SPORTATION

Y

JUNE 15, 1998
=Y

E DATE

REVISIONS

NO.| BY

DATE

CONSTRUCTION ACCESS

JUNE 15, 1998

ISSUE DATE

STRAW WATTLE

C5.00 SCALE: NONE

(o
NG

SILT FENCE

4R
NG

C5.00 SCALE: NONE

CHi ENGINEER CHIEF DESIGN E&Glﬁ-E—ERW "
ISPORTATION TRANSPORTATION

CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE

C5.00

()
NG

SCALE: NONE

1. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 209 OF THE R.l. STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS.

2. THIS INLET PROTECTION CAN ALSO BE USED WHEN CONSTRUCTION SEQUENCING REQUIRES
A CATCH BASIN TO BE EXPOSED TO SEDIMENT FROM THE SUBGRADE. THIS WILL BE
ACHIEVED BY INSTALLING THE BALED HAY AS SHOWN ON THIS DETAIL INTO THE
SUBGRADE.

3. THE PERIMETER CONFIGURATION OF THE BALED HAY WILL VARY DEPENDING ON THE
PARTICULAR TYPE OF CATCH BASIN INLET BEING CONSTRUCTED. THE ENGINEER WILL
PROVIDE SPECIFIC DIRECTION IN SUCH CASES.

EROSION CONTROL
DETAILS

SHEET MANAGEMENT

RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN Rl

DATE:

o BALED HAY CATCH BASIN
=l T O INLET PROTECTION
%ﬁﬁ( 4)‘4" %"ﬁa@aﬁﬁ“ﬁ :&JUEIEATJ 2, 1998

CRITERIA: 110" TUNNEL

PROJECT MANAGER:

REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN|

THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.
PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.
(NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022

INLET PROTECTION DETAILS

SHEET NUMBER

()
&/

C5.00 SCALE: NONE

C5.00




sevan

SILT FENCE NOTES (PAVEMENT AREAS):
1. FILTER CLOTH TO BE FASTENED SECURELY TO WOVEN WIRE FENCE

FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Ciizms\Stte gy \Maativika\aarc s tiitid tHetomRRD S Cob B SE DD b dhgyd ANST/SAIE BB P i ren &) Dalchdd SASAVEDADAT B/ 23 15720 2383 48\PRLOTOHDE B/ 15/15) 280 2306:06/PM

TYPICAL STABILIZER BRACKET

STABILIZER BRACKET AT GATE
OPENING

FINISHED PAVEMENT —\

THE UPHILL SIDE.
4. EXCAVATE A 6"x6" ANCHOR TRENCH AND BURYING THE TAIL OF THE
GEOTEXTILE FABRIC WITH BACKFILL COMPACTED UP AGAINST IT.

MAINTENANCE REQUIREMENTS:

1. PERFORM FREQUENT INSPECTIONS TO ASSURE THAT SILT FENCE IS
FIRMLY ENTRENCHED AND IN GOOD WORKING CONDITION. AT A
MINIMUM, INSPECT AFTER EACH MAJOR RUN-OFF EVENT.

(0]

ISOMETRIC

/ 1\ CONSTRUCTION FENCE

SAND BAGS AS REQUIRED

2. REMOVE ACCUMULATED SEDIMENT WHEN IT IS EQUALTO
APPROXIMATELY 25% OF THE FENCE HEIGHT.

3. REMOVE ANY DAMAGED, TORN, OR KNOCKED DOWN SILT FENCE
AND REPLACE IMMEDIATELY.

4. REMOVE SILT FENCE WHEN THE SITE HAS BEEN PERMANENTLY
STABILIZED.

CROSS-SECTION

C5.01 SCALE: NONE

12" x 18" FLAT SCREEN STEEL SIGN WITH WHITE LETTERS ON BLUE
BACKGROUND TO COMPLY WITH BARRIER-FREE GUIDELINES. BOLT
SIGN TO SUPPORT POST. PROVIDE SIGNS BOTH SIDES WHERE
INDICATED. ALSO, PROVIDE SIGNS WITH APPLICABLE WORDING
FOR FINE PENALTY PER LOCAL CODE.

STANDARD WHITE LETTERS
ON ARED 24" x 24"
BACKGROUND (MUTCD
STANDARD R1-1)

2 1/4" WIDE x 8'-0"

LONG U-CHANNEL

POST WITH BAKED

ON GREEN ENAMEL

FINISH.
~| || —DOME TOP 1| .
S, (TYPICAL) S
> o
=l [ =
= :
< | [ e

[ [
FINISHED I Il
PAVEMENT SEE NOTE 4
_v\ (TYPICAL)

* : < K : <
2 KRR LARZ T e
%O /\\//\| |//\\//\ AN \\//\| SN [ 7]

> AR’ }ole LA e |3

a3 NNEAN AR N NN NI S

: N7 Frs 7D Fr I E

BN Lt s

4" CONCRETE . I . I
BRICK-TYP 200 4 201
TYPE-1 TYPE-2 TYPE-1 TYPE-2

NOTES:

1. INSTALL ALL SIGNS WHERE INDICATED ON SITE PLAN.

2. ADJUST MOUNTING HEIGHTS TO MEET LOCAL CODES WHERE APPLICABLE.

3. SETALLPOSTSIN 16" DIAMETER x 36" DEEP CONCRETE FOUNDATION.

4. INSTALLALL SIGN PANELS A MINIMUM OF 1.0' BEHIND FACE OF CURB, AND BARRIER-FREE SIGNS A

MINIMUM OF 2.0' BEHIND BACK OF CURB.

4" x 6'-0" CONCRETE FILLED STEEL POST CENTERED IN FOUNDATION, PAINTED YELLOW, SEE SPECS.
21/4" WIDE x 6'-0" LONG U-CHANNEL POST WITH BAKED ON GREEN ENAMEL FINISH.

TYPE 1 - LIGHT DUTY -- LANDSCAPED AREAS and AREAS NOT SUBJECT TO TRUCK TRAFFIC.

TYPE 2 - HEAVY DUTY -- PAVED AREAS and AREAS SUBJECT TO TRUCK TRAFFIC or NOT PROTECTED
IN LANDSCAPED AREAS.

~No o

1.5" SURFACE COURSE
(RIDOT M03.02 CLASS I-1; PG 64-28)

2.5" BINDER COURSE

=4 \=4 \=>4 O\\// \=4 =4 \=4
QOQQ%Q%@@ (RIDOT M03.02 BINDER COURSE: PG 64-28)
u@%o O‘%@@
IS

6.0" GRANULAR SUBBASE
(RIDOT 304.02 SELECT LEVELING &
FILLER AGGREGATE)

COMPACTED BACKFILL OR NATIVE
SOIL TO 98% STANDARD PROCTOR

/5 ASPHALT PAVEMENT DETAIL

NOTES:
1. BUMPERS ARE REQUIRED WHEN NO CURB OR BARRIER IS PROVIDED WHICH

TOP OF SLAB
REF. ELEV. 100'-0"

4

#6 REINFORCING BAR x S 4

MINIMUM 42" BELOW GRADE

14" LONG, EACH WAY . a4 =2
18" @ CONCRETE FOOTING N = = ‘g
= LA

/

/7 PROTECTIVE BOLLARD

C5.01 SCALE: NONE

WILL PREVENT ENCROACHMENT OF CARS OVER REQUIRED WIDTH OF

POST MOUNTED ACCESSIBILITY SIGN PER VAN

WALKWAYS.

2. SPACES SHALL BE LOCATED SO THAT A PERSON/PEOPLE ARE NOT COMPELLED

TO WHEEL OR WALK BEHIND PARKED CARS OTHER THAN THEIR OWN.

RAMPS SHALL NOT ENCROACH INTO ANY PARKING SPACE OR ACCESS AISLE.

ACCESSIBLE SPACE SHALL BE NEAR PRIMARY ACCESSIBLE ENTRANCE OF

BUILDING.

5. PEDESTRIAN WAYS WHICH ARE ACCESSIBLE TO PEOPLE WITH DISABILITIES

SHALL BE PROVIDED FROM EACH ACCESSIBLE PARKING SPACE TO RELATED

FACILITIES, INCLUDING CURB CUTS OR RAMPS AS NEEDED.

REFER TO ACCESSIBLE PARKING SIGNS FOR REQUIRED SIGNAGE

THE SURFACE OF EACH PARKING SPACE FOR THE DISABLED IS REQUIRED TO

HAVE SYMBOL OF ACCESSIBILITY STENCIL PAINTED BLUE

8. PARKING SPACES SHALL BE MARKED WITH LINES, MEASUREMENTS OF SPACES
AND ACCESS AISLE SHALL BE FROM CENTERLINE OF MARKING.

9.  ACCESSIBLE SPACES SHALL BE SERVED BY AN ACCESS AISLE 60" WIDE
MINIMUM.

10. VAN PARKING STALL POSTED SIGN SHALL HAVE "VAN-ACCESSIBLE" TEXT
BELOW SYMBOL OF ACCESSIBILITY

11. PARKING SPACES FOR VANS AND ACCESS AISLE AND VEHICLE ROUTES SERVING
THEM SHALL PROVIDE A VERTICAL CLEARANCE OF 98"

12. AISLE MAY BE PLACED ON EITHER SIDE OF VEHICLE EXCEPT FOR VAN PARKING.

13. PARKING SPACES, ACCESS AISLES AND VEHICULAR ROUTES SERVING THEM

W

~No

NANN
4

ACCESSIBLE STALL TO HAVE "VAN ACCESSIBLE" SIGN
BELOW DISABLED PARKING SIGN SEE DETAIL ¢5.00

ACCESS AISLE SHALL BE MARKED SO ASTO
DISCOURAGE PARKING AND EXTEND FULL LENGTH
OF STALL DIAGONAL 4" STRIPES 36" O/C MAX. PAINT
N BLUE

SLOPE 1:48 MAX. IN ANY DIRECTION AT ACCESSIBLE
STALLS AND AISLES

/ 36" x 36" PAVEMENT SYMBOL OF ACCESSIBLE

ALL STRIPING AT ACCESSIBLE PARKING STALLS TO BE
BLUE

SHALL PROVIDE 98" VERT CLEARANCE.

14.  ACCESS AISLES SHALL EXTEND THE FULL REQUIRED LENGTH OF THE PARKING
SPACES THEY SERVE.

/Y ACCESSIBLE PARKING STALL

C5.01 SCALE: NONE

/ 6" 4,000 PSI CONCRETE

,— 12" CRUSHED GRAVEL
=

R R
NN NN NN NI NIONYINY. NN
ARG

~—COMPACTED BACKFILL OR
NATIVE SOIL TO 98%
STANDARD PROCTOR

75\ CONCRETE PAVING

EXPANSION JOINT

NOTES:
A . CONTROL JOINTS TO BE % " SAWCUT OR 7 " TOOLED AT 6'-0" O.C.
B. PLACE PRE-FORMED % " EXPANSION JOINT 30' O.C. ALONG ENTIRE LENGTH

C. PRE-FORMED %" EXPANSION JOINT SHALL BE INSTALLED AT ALL INTERSECTIONS OF BUILDING,

WALKS, AND ANY OTHER FIXED STRUCTURE.

/7 CONTROL AND EXPANSION JOINTS

INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY

CONTROL JOINT

CONCRETE WASH \é}
- , TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION '
——< X FENCE. SEE DETAIL WITH TIES SPACED EVERY 24" AT TOP AND MID SECTION. PAINT PIPE BOLLARD g ENGINEERING
w’Q‘Q / 5 2. WHEN TWO SECTIONS OF FILTER CLOTH ADJOIN EACH OTHER THEY TRAFFIC YELLOW CONCRETE SIDEWALK
”‘0‘0 PORTABLE TEMPORARY SHALL BE OVERLAPPED BY SIX INCHES AND FOLDED. T
”‘0‘0 CHAIN LINK FENCE PANEL 3. MAINTENANCE SHALL BE PERFORMED AS NOTED IN THE EROSION 6" @ STEEL PIPE BOLLARD . EXE-WL AXW14 W W E. 1" SAW CUT SAWCUT
”‘0‘0 CONTROL PLAN. COLLECTED MATERIAL SHALL BE REMOVED WHEN FILLED SOLID WITH CONCRETE _ WALKS AT 50" O.C.
XXX "BULGES" DEVELOP IN THE SILT FENCE. S | i
50‘0’0’ FILTER FABRIC: . ~ 14" EXPANSION JOINT NOT ..
&0’:’ 1. MIRAFI 140NS SILT FENCE NOTES (STANDARD): SLOPE CONCRETE BASE o |  TOEXCEED 300" ApART | | |
5 0‘0‘0‘ P o 2. PHILLIPS 66 SUPAC 4NP 1. INSTALLALONG A CONTOUR LINE ON A SLOPE OF EQUAL AWAY FROM PIPE BOLLARD : ‘ A R L | ComorateOffice:
“""‘Q‘Q‘.‘A‘ﬁ XA 3. DUPONT TYPAR 3341 ELEVATION : R R — T 3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
X T % . - - - . . :
XK ST o 4.OR APPROVED EQUAL  —— | 2. DO NOT INSTALL IN AN AREA OF CONCENTRATED FLOW. N T T T T T T T T Downers Grove, IL 60515
AR X N 3. INSTALL WITH GEOTEXTILE FABRIC ATTACHED TO FENCE POSTS ON . ' y% e e e e e e Q‘@ \ info@sevansolutions.com  www.sevansolutions.com
: =

REVISIONS

=
©

DATE | DESCRIPTION

03.03.2022|SITE PLAN REVIEW

06.30.2022| REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT

08.05.2022|REVISED PER RIDOT

08.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM

09.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

11.21.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW

12.08.2022(REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE

12.13.2022|REVISED SITE PAVING

01.09.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

C5.01 SCALE: NONE

RETURNED CURB
PAVEMENT ‘\

X S RORRRIIR

AR R LR

A A A AN
yind SUBGRADE PER SOILS REPORT

W.W.F. BROOM FINISH CONCRETE WI

SCORES AT 6" ON CENTER. PLACE %"
EXPANSION JOINT AT TOP OF RAMP

\
AAN
RO 2 4" COMPACTED GRAVEL

RETURN CURB TO BE FLUSH
WITH TOP OF WALK

TRUNCATED DOMES

/7

DIAGRAM

NOTES:

A. CURB RAMP SHOWN WITH RETURNED CURB AT SIDES SHALL HAVE NON-WALKING SURFACE ON
EITHER SIDE. ALTERNATE DESIGN INCLUDES FLARED SIDES NOT TO EXCEED 1:10 SLOPE.

B. PER FEDERAL REGULATION 28 CFR PART 36, RAMP TO HAVE MAXIMUM RUNNING SLOPE OF 1:12
AND MAXIMUM CROSS SLOPE OF 1:50 IN AS-BUILT CONDITION. SEE GRADING PLAN FOR DESIGN
SLOPE AND SPOT ELEVATIONS.

C. VERIFY SIZE AND STYLE (STRAIGHT, FLARED SIDES) OF RAMP WITH SITE IMPROVEMENT PLAN.

/s \ ACCESSIBLE CURB RAMP

C5.01 SCALE: NONE

4" CONCRETE SLAB WITH 6X6 - W1.4XW1.4

TH

4!1

1.33

[Noll el BN o)l O, i BN OO I O N Y K=

01.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
o

02.01.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
[N

02.06.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT

—_
No

02.14.2023|REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT

CONSULTANT

C5.01 SCALE: NONE

C5.01 SCALE: NONE

77\ CONCRETE CURB
NG

SEAL

TIMOTHY KRATZ

\ /
02/15/2023 \/

/10 PAVEMENT MARKINGS

2O
GENERAL NOTES: 2 N
i ! 1. ALL MARKINGS SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION T.20 OF THE RI STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS. e
2. ALL CROSSWALK AND STOP LINE MARKINGS SHALL BE WHITE. CROSSWALK DETAIL = 8
3. CROSSWALK AND STOP LINE MARKINGS SHALL ONLY BE INSTALLED WHERE CALLED FOR ON THE PLANS. v
CROSSWALK NOTES: T RN 5
ant . 1. CROSSWALK WIDTH SHALL BE 8'—0” UNLESS OTHERWISE CALLED FOR ON THE PLANS. s 1"—~0" WIDE WHITE CROSSWALK' LINE S
i uy o : < 2. CROSSWALK MARKINGS SHALL BE LAID OUT ONLY AFTER MEASUREMENT OF THE ACTUAL / |—>4 \ ]
. B ny o DISTANCE BETWEEN EDGES OF PAVEMENT ALONG THE CENTERLINE OF THE PROPOSED CROSSING. = o~
o ) - as THE FIRST CROSSWALK MARKING ESTABLISHED SHALL BE A 1’—0” WIDE LINE CENTERED UPON THE >
I (1' il . MIDPOINT OF THIS CENTERLINE. EACH GAP BETWEEN ADJACENT CROSSWALK LINES SHALL BE 2'-0" / = \ o
S s - RS N WIDE. THE SPACE BETWEEN EACH CROSSWALK LINE CLOSEST TO THE EDGE OF PAVEMENT AND THE f ) \ =l
o : T LATTER MAY BE LESS THAN 2’—0" WIDE, BUT SUCH SPACES AT BOTH ENDS OF EACH INDIVIDUAL /1 - \ 0
: T CROSSWALK SHALL BE OF EQUAL LENGTH UNLESS THE CONDITION OF NOTE 4 OR 5 APPLIES. /] Q¥ } — L2
Lars ; 3. CROSSWALK LINES SHALL BE ORIENTED IN—LINE AND PARALLEL WITH THE / ‘\ |5 | o)
ans PREDOMINANT PATH OF VEHICLES PASSING OVER THE CROSSWALK; TYPICALLY THIS N O / —
WILL BE PARALLEL TO THE CURB LINE OF THE UPSTREAM ROADWAY APPROACH. y L / <C
] 4. SHORTER SEGMENTS OF THE CROSSWALK LINE MARKINGS SHALL BE / % o~ ﬂ
INSTALLED AT THE ENDS OF CROSSWALKS WHERE REQUIRED TO ENSURE / o =
THAT THE CROSSWALK IS MARKED OVER THE ENTIRE DISTANCE OF THE / - / || =
—— CROSSING BETWEEN EDGES OF PAVEMENT. / AN FT’+ e 2 —
5. WHERE TWO CROSSWALKS MEET, THE ORIENTATION OF THE / AN 2'—0” GAP (SEE CROSSWALK NOTE 2) <|un y
CROSSWALK LINES INSTALLED ACROSS THE MAJOR ROADWAY / S~ — Eloa g
SHALL BE CARRIED TO THE EDGE OF PAVEMENT. THE ROADWAY /) e Z=| B
RUNNING LEFT TO RIGHT IS THE MAJOR ROADWAY IN THIS ; e w = %
Rl = 3'-2" DETAIL. * / e Oo|X g
R2 = 2’—2. y ”» //—_\\ /// = % D g
STOP LINE NOTES: 4'-0 /- N - ZISZ|  |es
5'—9” 1. STOP LINE WIDTH SHALL BE 1'—0” UNLESS L = < £z
OTHERWISE CALLED FOR ON THE PLANS. ( l WER| CROSSWALK WIDTH AT CURB L|N% CEI;ITERED |0—: — N &g
SN N NN NOTES: a HN ON WHEELCHAIR RAMP LANDING (TYP. b2
T s 2. UNLESS OTHERWISE CALLED FOR ON THE 5 - pd g
uE S IR 2. THE LONGITUDINAL SPACE BETWEEN WORD CROSSWALK OR, IF NO CROSSWALK IS :_CR_: R
mey A OR SYMBOL MESSAGES, INCLUDING ARROWS, MARKED, PARALLEL TO THE EDGE OF THE EDGE OF PAVEMENT | W EDGE OF PAVEMENT al|l> =
3 | SHOULD BE AT LEAST FOUR TIMES THE NEAREST INTERSECTING TRAVELED WAY =<
| HEIGHT OF THE CHARACTER FOR LOW SPEED ' 4 o =|aWwn
8'-0"| - ROADS BUT NOT MORE THAN TEN TIMES THE WHITE EDGE LINE (TYP.) — MIN. 4-0" x 4-0 —— 1 )
s | m=m HEIGHT OF THE CHARACTER UNDER ANY WHEELCHAIR RAMP ———— 1'=0" WIDE WHITE STOP LINE 2% B
a8 CONDITIONS. LANDING AREA SHALL — (TYP., SEE STOP LINE NOTE 1) O
== i 3. THE SPACING OF THE PAVEMENT MARKINGS 4-0"——  — BE PROVIDED ENTIRELY — a
s B WILL BE AS SHOWN ON THE PLAN AND AS e — DD S SHALK — o C
- PER THE MUTCD. DOUBLE YELLOW _/ (TYP. SHOWN) T g
W s W 4. SYMBOLS AND WORDS SHALL MEET THE CENTER LINE (TYP.) — ‘ — Vo o= &
SanREmREEREREEE, REQUIREMENTS OF THE FHWA "STANDARD — —— 4-0 ~2
ALPHABET AND SYMBOLS FOR HIGHWAY B2
PAVEMENT MARKINGS. WHITE EDGE LIE (TP.)—\ — e —— pNE
"
WHEELCHAIR RAMP (WCR) (TYP. SHOWN, \§I§§
ACTUAL ALIGNMENTS/SIZES VARY) 33
RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION §§§
23
REVISIONS =
NO.| BY | DATE Pﬁgggﬁg-r AmSng&S R.I SEE CROSSWALK NOTE 5 -
i, STANDARD =
,(é:“, :%M JUNE 15. 1998 20.1.0 SEE CROSSWALK NOTE 4 (TYP. SHOWN) 21°
cHiglf ENGINEER 7 CHIEF DESIGN ENGINEER ISSUE DATE T 8
ATION TRANSPORTATION = >
o S
s
=z

C5.01 SCALE: NONE

C5.01 SCALE: NONE

CUSTOMER

ashville

Your Hometown Car Wash

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

WASHVILLE CARWASH

PROJECT LOCATION

991-995 W MAIN RD
MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842

(NEWPORT COUNTY)

SHEET TITLE

SITE DETAILS

SHEET MANAGEMENT

PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN Rl

DATE:

CRITERIA: 110" TUNNEL

PROJECT MANAGER:

THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.

REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN|
PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.

(NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022

SHEET NUMBER

C5.01




e e sevan

FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Ciizms\Stte g \Maativika\aairs stitid tHetomrRRD i Cob B & DD 2 gy ANST/SAAIE BB P Réwsiren &) Dalckid SASAPEDADAT E11277272022 32 FMP M BTOHDE B/ 25/15)292306:06/PM

CONSTRUCTION JOINT (TYP.) EPOXY COATED DOWEL —5/8"x2 1/4” ENGINEERING
DOWEL SOCKET 5" SQ. POST \ f 6-0" 0.C. OR LESS 1
DETECTABLE WARNING RI STD. 48.1.0 ~ ) 6 1/2" =
VARIES GUTTER LINE 12 _ch / »
P —————————— N %o 7" 7" TOP RAIL
WHEELCHAIR RAMP — s I — % _
TRANSITION CURB | s 9"
Rl STD 713 L | Corporate Office:
RI STD. 7.3.3 3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
BATTER (SEE TABLE) 31/2— |— % Downers Grove, IL 60515
info@sevansolutions.com www.sevansolutions.com
3’—0” MIN.
| 3 " ’I O” INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY
6 —0 MAX. 7/8" X 6" T&G PICKET
REVISIONS
TRANSITION LENGTH FROTTOMRAL : NO DATE DESCRIPTION
] ¢ :
LENGTH VARIES | LENGTH VARIES LENGTH \ j‘t 0 [03.03.2022)SITE PLAN REVIEW
\ 1 106.30.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT
VARIES B I N =
- IMPRESSIONS VINYL - SOLID e 2 |08.05.2022(REVISED PER RIDOT
A " PRIVACY 6' WIDE - INTERNAL CAP - ~
BY MASTER HALCO OR SIMILAR. | 3 108.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM
GRADE | _ SR HERE 4 (09.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
< COMPACTEDCAMRA?E@???ZEE\ 111 11 5 [11.21.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
o o VERIFY ALL PROPERTY LINES W/ N [
- AA, SURVEYOR PRIOR TO INSTALLATION -1 1- 6 [12.08.2022|REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE
N MR 7 112.13.2022|REVISED SITE PAVING
8 101.09.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
1 9 101.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
TRANSITION B?ITI\-IFER m 6" HIGH SCREEN FENCE 10 {02.01.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
LENGTH (FT. . 01,
( ) @ SCALE: NO SCALE 11 (02.06.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
6.0 1.5
T LOW 12 102.14.2023|REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT
STANDARD CURB SECTIONS OR WHEELCHAIR RAN’S|T|Q,§'DE WHEELCHAIR RAMP ;‘8 ]g
RAMP TRANSITION CURB AS REQUIRED CURg TRQNE'TT[')ON7 ?UZRB 5 s
ISOMETRIC VIEW RI STD. 7.1.3 15138 8’2
NOT TO SCALE RI STD. 7.3.2 1820 025
GRANITE STD. 7.3.9
PCC STD. 7.1.9
RAMP STONE CURB LINE NOTES:
1. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 906 OF THE R.l. STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS.
RAMP LANDING 2. CIRCULAR CURB IS REQUIRED ON CURVES WITH RADII OF 160'—0”0OR LESS. STRAIGHT CONSULTANT
SAVEMENT VARIES VARIES CURB TO BE USED ON CURVES OF MORE THAN 160°'—0”RADIUS.
2’—0" MIN. 4’—0” MIN. 3. EXPOSED EDGES TO HAVE A 3/4” CHAMFER.
1-50 4. EXPOSED SURFACES TO HAVE A SPONGE FLOAT FINISH.
12 NAX 5. MINIMUM LENGTH OF STRAIGHT OR CIRCULAR CURB FILLER PIECES TO BE 3'—0" (GREATER
ROADWAY T MAX. { : LENGTHS PREFERRED).
PROFILE GRADE || (FT.) : ‘
0.00 6.0
0.01 70 L |LANDING AND TRANSITIONS RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
ONCRETE 4” STD. 43.1.0
0.02 8.0 CONC — RBEY\"S'ONSDATE PRECAST CONCRETE WHEELCHAIR RAMP SEAL
: R.I.
0.03 95 RAMP AND FLARES (SEE NOTE 16) L v TRANSITION CURB il
SECTION A—A CONCRETE 4” AND 8” STD. 43.1.0
0.04 1.5 T T0 SCALE /L 44 SHtif @l f).  JUNE 15, 1998 7.1.3 TIMOTHY KRATZ
0.05 15.0 GRAVEL BORROW ToldlsPORTATION TRANSPORTATION R ISSUE DATE
DETECTABLE WARNING RI STD. 48.1.0
NOTES:
1. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 905 OF THE RI STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS.
2. WHEN ANY OBSTRUCTION LOCATED IN THE SIDEWALK FALLS WITHIN A CROSSWALK AREA, THE WHEELCHAIR RAMP SHALL BE
PLACED SUCH THAT THE OBSTRUCTION FALLS OUTSIDE OF THE RAMP. ——
3. AT NO TIME IS ANY PART OF THE WHEELCHAIR RAMP TO BE LOCATED OUTSIDE OF THE CROSSWALK, AND IT IS TO BE 02/15/2023 \_/
CENTERED WHENEVER POSSIBLE.
4. DRAINAGE FACILITIES ARE TO BE LOCATED UP—GRADE OF ALL WHEELCHAIR RAMPS.
5. LOCATION OF WHEELCHAIR RAMPS IS AS SHOWN ON CONTRACT DRAWINGS. CUSTOMER
6. IN NO INSTANCE SHALL THE SIDEWALK CROSS SLOPE EXCEED 1:50 EXCEPT WITHIN THE RAMP AREA.
7. AN UNOBSTRUCTED PATH OF TRAVEL WITH A MINIMUM WIDTH OF 4°—0” SHALL BE MAINTAINED.
8. THE WHEELCHAIR RAMP SLOPE AND SIDE SLOPES (TRANSITIONS), MUST NOT BE STEEPER THAN 1:12. HOWEVER, THESE )
SLOPES MAY BE FLATTER THAN 1:12 WHEN WARRANTED BY SURROUNDING CONDITIONS. =
9. WHERE THE ROAD PROFILE EXCEEDS 5% THE HIGH SIDE TRANSITION LENGTH (T) SHALL BE EIGHTEEN FEET (18’—0"). -II
10. IN NO CASE, WHERE A STOP LINE IS WARRANTED, SHALL A RAMP BE PLACED BEHIND THE STOP LINE. Qasnipuviiiie
11. THE ENTRANCE OF THE WHEELCHAIR RAMP SHALL BE FLUSH WITH THE ROADWAY. You wash
12. THE WHEELCHAIR RAMP SHALL BE CENTERED RADIALLY, OPPOSITE THE RADIUS POINT WHEN POSSIBLE. rHometown Car
13. MINIMUM LENGTH OF STRAIGHT OR CIRCULAR FILLER PIECES TO BE 3'—0” (GREATER LENGTHS PREFERRED).
14. ALL REQUIRED CUTTING OF CURB PIECES TO BE PAID FOR UNDER COST OF CURB.
15. DETECTABLE WARNINGS TO BE PAID FOR UNDER SECTION 942 OF THE RI STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS S ROJECT DESCRIPTION
16. 8” CONCRETE DEPTH FOR RADIUS WHEELCHAIR RAMPS ONLY. USE 4” DEPTH FOR TANGENT (MID—BLOCK) LOCATIONS.
RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
REVISIONS WASHVILLE CARWASH
NO. BY DATE WHEELCHA'R RAMP R.I.
1 | MLP |Oct 2005 STANDARD
2 [ MLP [Jun 2008 ) 77
3 [ MP [Sep 2012] C_jporen /T (gnadels’ el JUNE 15, 1998 43.3.0
CHIE &’ ENGINEER CHIEF DESIGN ENGINEER <~ ISSUE DATE
TR??SPORTATION TRANSPORTATION PRO J ECT LOC AT'ON
/1 ACCESSIBLE CURB RAMP 991-995 W MAIN RD
C5.02 SCALE: NONE
NG MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842
(NEWPORT COUNTY)
SHEET TITLE
SHEET MANAGEMENT
PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN R
DATE: -
CRITERIA: 110" TUNNEL
PROJECT MANAGER:
(NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
SHEET NUMBER
C5.02




FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Cims\Stte g \Maatiwika\aarsstitid thetomRRD S Cob B SE DD 3hahey d ANST/SAAIE BB P i e §) Dalchid SASAEDADAT B/ /50202 B FMP M BTOADE B/ 151528 2306:06/PM

MIN 10 LF 6" PERFORATED S e \/ a I '
CORRUGATED PLASTIC STANDARD ENGINEERING
DRAINTILE WITH SOCK; MANHOLE CASTING L BITUMINOUS
PAVED AREAS UNPAVED AREAS SURROUNDED DRAINTILE WITH 8" CONCRETE 2 M. PAVEMENT
— MDOT 34R OR APPROVED COLLAR
A N EQUAL
N v WIRE MESH
NEW PAVEMENT OR PATCH MOUND BACK-FILLED 6Xo-W1.4XWL.4 SLOPE 0.10' FROM
PAVEMENT TO MATCH EXISTING \ ASPHALT TO CASTING
(UNLESS SPECIFIED OTHERWISE) SOIL APPROXIMATELY 67, e : - Corporate Office:
MAINTAIN POSITIVE NOTES: _ . o 4 R Y 3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
SLOPE TOWARDS CATCH X| N — 2 T _— - - R Downers Grove, IL 60515
Sﬁgfgg/f?ggrgiN%Ap'\fTégmé BASIN(S) OR CURB(S) A. WHERE BACKFILL IS DESIGNATED "COMPACTED", THIS MEANS 90% TO 95% STANDARD PROCTOR, IR :@ Q PR ij% QD info@sevansolutions.com  wwi.sevansolutions.com
_ ) [ [ [ [ [ [ [ [ [ [ [
AASHTO T-99. ALL FILL PLACED BELOW PIPES AND STRUCTURES MUST MEET THIS REQUIREMENT. < % Egjé :é ;O ; . = émjégjé ;o ;OQOOC NTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMMWORK | EXCELLENGE | CHARIY
B. FOR ALL TRENCHES WITH A GRADE GREATER THAN 4% AND/OR WHERE GROUNDWATER IS N R R NSNS e TSIONS
P oo | _ % SRS APPARENT, INSTALL CLAY DAMS AROUND PIPE AT 100' INTERVALS. SRR — T — i ) NN
~\/\\/{\\>//>\>/;\\>/;\\\//;\ 2 : R />§\///\\\/<\\ \ COMPACTED / N NO.| DATE | DESCRIPTION
— 6" @N\\//\s SUBGRADE 0 [03.03.2022|SITE PLAN REVIEW
O' S
= ' INIMUM BURIAL DEPTH RECOMMENDED FILL MATERIALS FRAME AND COVER 6" MIN 1 |06.30.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT
= ) MINIMUM BURIAL DEPT PER C1.31 ALL SIDES GRADE OR 2 08.05.2022|REVISED PER RIDOT
) PER LOCAL JURISDICTION C13
= SUITABLE FILL **SELECT LINING PAVEMENT
rw 0 MATERIAL PER CONDITION & PIPE "y | CONCRETE ADJUSTMENT RINGS 3 |08.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM
p | MATERIAL | MATERIAL SURFACE (MIN. 6" OF RISER RINGS) 4 109.29.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
% S DUCTILE IRON PIPE IN GAND OR TYPE| _, 6" COMPACTED ' -
2 "ORDINARY SOIL" TYPEL LI Ly 3 D e o 5 [11.21.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
o
- RCP PIPE IN "ORDINARY SAND OR TYPE 1 6 112.08.2022|REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE
(@] n
= s SoIL" TYPEIL Iy 3 49 m 7 [12.13.2022|REVISED SITE PAVING
=) 5=
LB CURROUNDING 3 3 ALL PIPE OVER BEDROCK e PANDORTYRE[ . N 3 CONCRETE COLLAR IN PAVED AREAS 8 {01.09.2023[REVISED PER EASEMENT
| £3© MATERIAL N X BEDDING AND OR LEDGE : I NEN ; @0 C5.03 SCALE: NONE 9 [01.23.2023REVISED PER EASEMENT
< + N N SURROUNDING MATERIALS 4 . o
= 2 % DUCTILE IRON PIPEIN ! : ! < 10 [02.01.2023(REVISED PER EASEMENT
N N\ TO BE COMPACTED CLAY OR MUCK TYPEIL, Il [SAND 4 DRAINTILE S ] O > 0L
@ ! BEDDING MATERIAL < \\{ ] - B 11 |02.06.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
X X/ X / n g 4
\/.\\//\\\///\\ﬂ//\\\/\\} K RCP PIPE IN CLAY TYPEIL Il [SAND 6 ! N : 12 [02.14.2023[REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT
A GE SANDOR _BAND OR TVPE PRECAST CONCRETE ™ BUILDING DOWNSPOUT PER ARCHITECTURAL
MIN. D+15' PLASTIC-ALL VP Du 6" MANHOLE AS.T.M. i - INTERIOR DRAWINGS
COMAX DY UNDISTURBED GROUND 478 - SEE PLAN
- . o L CONNECTED TO ROOF DRAIN LINE
NOTES: *  SUITABLE MATERIAL SHOULD CONTAIN NO STONES GREATER THAN 4" IN DIAMETER, NO FROZEN SSTTEEPESqu';"‘-lgle wl - % A WITH BOOT REDUCER
1. THE SURROUND MATERIAL MUST BE INSTALLED TO THE PAVEMENT BASE ELEVATION IF THERE IS w RAAZ?IQ’\EJ?\AOC')\'FLYJ{]'SE%%S %'SIASP%%SYB%EO%FEGQ'XE%AIEEQ'TALH‘F/?LL MATERIAL TO BE PLACED (ASPHALT COATED) - = ’V
LESS THAN 2'-0" OF FILL OVER THE PIPE. : \ . B EESEI\C/)ISEE\ID'I' FC;E%I; AGSRSADE \
ALL MANHOLES L i So
** TYPE | MATERIAL SHALL BE EITHER GRAVEL OR EXCAVATED MATERIAL CONTAINING NO STONES , g S o
2. COMPACT ALL BACK FILL UNDERNEATH, AROUND AND ABOVE PROPOSE PIPES TO 95% STANDARD " SHALL HAVE POURED o ' =5z A NN AN AN NN AN NN
PROCTOR IN PAVED AND STRUCTURAL AREAS, 90% STANDARD PROCTOR IN UNPAVED OR GREATER THAN 174" IN DIAMETER, NO CLAY, AND NO ORGANIC MATERIAL. FLOWLINES | | =232 WW CONSUITANT
R " — = % SN TN N TN LN TN LN TN SN N
O e oA s KL MATER AL N PAVED/STRUCTURAL ** TYPE Il MATERIAL SHALL BE CLEAN, HARD, CRUSHED OR NATURAL STONE WITH A GRADATION BY \ e 88| B SIS CONNECT TO'STORM LINE ™S5
- - Y a T . 7/
° ( ) WEIGHT OF 100% PASSING A 125 " SQUARE OPENING, NOT MORE THAN 25% PASSING A %" SQUARE Rh @ =) /;\ \\/\\\/;\\} SFES RSEgRNl\T/Il\&VS/I_EIFBIT\ILAN >/;\\>
9 " n F<’ - T X NN \<
3. WHERE A PIPE HAS A SLOPE GREATER THAN OR EQUAL TO 4% OR WHERE GROUNDWATER IS . OPENING AND NOT MORE THAN 5% PASSING A 73" SQUARE OPENING. 6" | . 22 LRI
F;F;%SSHB%E\YPEAEMS SHALL BE INSTALLED AROUND THE PIPE EVERY 100" TO PREVENT WASHOUT ** TYPE Il MATERIAL SHALL BE CLEAN, HARD, CRUSHED STONE FREE FROM COATINGS AND a R
: THOROUGHLY WASHED WITH A GRADATION BY WEIGHT OF 100% PASSING A 1" SQUARE OPENING “ . //i\\///i\\///i\ \\\ FLOW —=
4. ALLSUITABLE FILL SHOULD NOT CONTAIN STONES GREATER THAN 4" IN DIAMETER, FROZEN AND 0-5% PASSING A 7" SQUARE OPENING. o NN
R RN RN,
LUMPS, AND SHALL CONTAIN A MINIMAL AMOUNT OF ORGANIC MATERIALS (LESS THAN 3%). ARG
PLACE PRECAST BASE R RRIRIRRLRURRRURRRRRAR:
" ON 6" CRUSHED e
5. MATERIAL IS TO BE PLACED AT NO MORE THAN 8" INTERVALS AND COMPACTED BEFORE PLACING _/ BUILDING (2) 45° WIDE SWEEP ELBOWS, ASSURE SEAL
NEXT LAYER. STONE FOOTING CLEARANCE OF FOOTING. MATERIAL TO
NOTE: NOTES: MATCH DOWNSPOUT RUNS
ALL FRAMES AND COVERS FOR DRAINAGE STRUCTURES SHALL BE NON-ROCKING AND MADE OF HEAVY :
DUTY CAST IRON. A.  TYPICAL GRADE ADJACENT TO BUILDING SHALL BE 7" LOWER THAN F.F.E.L. TIMOTHY KRATZ
IF CATCH BASIN LOCATED IN CURB GUTTER, EXTEND DRAINTILE ALONG BACK OF CURB IN BOTH B.  SEE GRADING PLAN FOR LOCATIONS
DIRECTIQNS.
/{\ PIPE BEDDING , STORM MANHOLE m DOWNSPOUT/DRAIN LEADER CONNECTION
C5.03 SCALE: NONE C5.03 SCALE: NONE C5.03 SCALE: NONE
\ J |
02/15/2023 \_/
CAST IRON/ DUCTILE IRON SANITARY SEWER STORM SEWER
CLEANOUT COVER, SEE
COVER LETTERING BELOW A A CUSTOMER
ASPHALT OR CONCRETE O o
AS DETERMINED BY L
TRAFFIC SURFACE \ PROVIDE RUBBER GASKSET l\/lllsll_l\aUM N
2'—2 -
FINISHED GRADE MANHOLE y
' I s JOINTS = RING asSiniviie
. . H= EQUIDISTANT 5|2
SN NN =5 FROM SEWER e Your Hometown Car Wash
W =
, =9 AN — —
o | I C RE | - - PROJECT DESCRIPTION
3,000PSI CONCRETE —— || | [ K& L =] FRAME AND COVER
o R 7 LATERAL OR - a%é PLAN /— NOTES:
~ LATERAL RISER MAIN SEWER s
JOINT j/ \E\L o A B 1. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE
WITH SECTION 702 OF THE R.L
4" OR 6" 45° Y, LONG o UDISTANT MANHOLE = 1 STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS. WASHVILLE CARWASH
ALLOWED) 6" X 6" X 6" OR
wy " . . AND OUTSIDE SURFACES.
6" X 6" WITH 4" REDUCING 5-0 50 S 3. REFER TO STD. 5.2.0 FOR
BRANCH AS REQUIRED WYE FITTINGS ONLY MINIMUM MINIMUM BRICK 13 ™ MAXIMUM PIPE SIZES
TEES NOT ALLOWED v . PROJECT LOCATION
DIRECTION OF FLOW FLOW | 3 =)
7]
( . @) 2 . 991-995 W MAIN RD
==y \ » MIDDLETOWN, Rl 02842
A STD. 5.3.0 %
1'-0” 0.C M.
JOINT LATERAL — o | ™
BRICK /SOLID | BLOCK - ; (NEWPORT COUNTY)
STONE BEDDING STONE BEDDING . 8” 4’-0” 8” w
I\/Ilsl-l\(A)UM 3 SHEET TITLE
FLEXIBLE RUBBER JOINT 3000 PSI CONCRETE — o
CONNECTOR, PER ASTM ENCASED (DRY MIX NOT 4" 1:25 S
C-594 WITH CONCRETE ALLOWED) (TYP.) —
CRADLE (3000 PSI) T‘ !
LENGTH AS SPECIFIED ON { UTILITY DETAILS
PLANS EXCAVATE AS . L R P
REQUIRED AND PROVIDE N e e Lo N N ]
FERNCO SUPPORT O PREVENT 6,,_} L 2 cover \ 3" COVER (TYP))
COUPLING : »
#5 @ 7" E.W. BRICK/SOLID BLOCK INVERT
LETTERING ON COVER LETTERING ON COVER CONCRETE BASE
B 1/2 ¢ OF PIPE SHEET MANAGEMENT
STORM SEWER SANITARY SEWER (PRECAST OPTIONAL)
NOTE: SECTION A—A PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN R
= DATE: -
IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT ALL SOLVENT WELD JOINTS BE MADE AS FOLLOWS:
© o oo hoas 2 S0 RHODE ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION CRTEE o TONEL
' ' EVISIONS PROJECT MANAGER: -
B. PR'MER APPL'ED TO PARTS BElNG CONNECTED NO BE;/ DATE B RICK/SO LI D BLOCK THIS DOCUMENT IS AND SHALL REMAIN THE PROPERTY OF
" . , ” SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC.
C. SANITARY CLEANOUT MATERIALS: 6" SDR 23.5 PIPE. MATERIAL CAN BE ABS WITH SOLVENT WELDED k/AIZIE\IRélE-V%FE{R 6" BEDDING STONE (MINIMUM) 4 - O ROU N D MAN HO LE REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WAITEN
JOINTS OR PVC WITH ELASTOMERIC GASKETED JOINTS. / . JUNE 15. 1998 (NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
. N 2 COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022
D. STORMWATER CLEANOUT MATERIALS: 6" SCH. 80 PVC WITH GLUED JOINTS. opf enoneer 44/‘ MMWER ISSUE DATE
SHEET NUMBER

/s _STORM & SANITAY CLEAN-OUT /"5 \_SANITARY CROSSING /7 _STORM MANHOLE (FOR USE ON MH-6) WITHIN ROW C5.03

C5.03 SCALE: NONE C5.03 SCALE: NONE C5.03 SCALE: NONE




FILE NAME: Y:\Shared\Clients\Siteology\Washville\Main St Middletown R\DS\ConDocs\C6.10.dwg LAST SAVED BY: Pastrana, Osvaldo SAVED DATE: 2/15/2023 3:56 PM PLOTTED: 2/15/2023 4:07 PM

ENGINEERING
Corporate Office:
3025 Highland Parkway, Suite 850
Downers Grove, IL 60515
info@sevansolutions.com www.sevansolutions.com
INTEGRITY | RESPECT | TEAMWORK | EXCELLENCE | CHARITY
REVISIONS
NO.| DATE | DESCRIPTION
0 [03.19.2022[SITE PLAN REVIEW
1 [06.30.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM AND RIDOT
2 [08.05.2022[REVISED PER RIDOT
3 |08.25.2022|REVISED PER RIDEM
— 4 [09.29.2022[REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
= 5 [11.21.2022|REVISED PER TOWN REVIEW
. _ -_ x LU 6 [12.08.2022|REVISED PER VAC ENCLOSURE
| E 7 [12.13.2022|REVISED SITE PAVING
. - - T o 8 |01.09.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
| &'&c < 0O 9 |01.23.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
| | % EE) 10 02.01.2023|REVISED PER EASEMENT
|| J T 11 02.06.2023| REVISED PER EASEMENT
, 2 n 12 02.14.2023| REVISED PER FENCE HEIGHT
| T o0 CLG
| B —
5 | 23
<
o) 1 18 g} W <
m | | OPENING FOR SITE
N | CONSTRUCTION ACCESS
| ) SIDEWALK
3> | ) SIDEWALK CLOSED
Yéf\ | CLOSED AHEAD CONSULTANT
SIDEWALK Z END = CROSS
CLOSED C ROAD WORK SIDEWALK OPENING TO ALLOW EXIT HERE
ALEAD m CLOSED § d FROM SHOPPING CENTER
CROSS NESSl MU0 [y oy H?/
N
HERE < {\ o A IS —— o —
0000000000000 0000000000000 000000000000 / Q000000 O0000POOOOOOOOO0O0000 000 Q00 0O 0Og OOO
K4l 7
— WEST MAIN ROAD - ROUTE 114 —
< > < » o
~ 7 = T —— ARROW BOARD
TRAFFIC BARRELS SELECTED FROM < e
PEDESTRIAN RIDOT APPROVED MATERIALS LIST TEMPORARY CRASH BARREL TIMOTHY KRATZ
3 DETOUR ROUTE CHANNEL DEVICES o
OPENING TO ALLOW e
ENTRANCE FROM o)
SHOPPING CENTER o
{p)
OPENING TO ALLOW (&
ENTRANCE AND EXIT FROM ®
EAST BAY APARTMENTS 4
\ J
MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC PLAN Q2SR \J
SCALE: 1"=50"-0" 0 50’ 100’ CUSTOMER
e T ——
M;Ilm'//e
Your Hometown Car Wash
NOTES:
PROJECT DESCRIPTION
1. ALL TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL CONFIGURATIONS AND DEVICES, THEIR INSTALLATION,
MAINTENANCE, AND REMOVAL SHALL CONFORM TO THE LATEST EDITION OF THE "MANUAL ON
UNIFORM TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES" (MUTCD), WITH ALL REVISIONS, AND THE LATEST
EDITION OF THE "RIDOT STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS FOR ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION"
HITH AL REVISIOS WASHVILLE CARWASH
2. ALL TEMPORARY CONTROL DEVICES SHALL BE IN PLACE PRIOR TO THE START OF WORK.
3. ALL TEMPORARY CONTROL DEVICES SHALL BE REMOVED AS SOON AS PRACTICAL WHEN THEY
ARE NO LONGER NEEDED, SUCH AS AFTER ROADWAY UTILITY AND SIDEWALK WORK IS
COMPLETE. WHEN WORK IS SUSPENDED FOR A SHORT PERIOD OF TIME, TEMPORARY TRAFFIC
CONTROL DEVICES THAT ARE NO LONGER APPROPRIATE SHALL BE REMOVED OR COVERED. PROJECT LOCATION
23+ .
—-— = ..., - 4. DISTANCES ARE A GUIDE AND MAY BE ADJUSTED IN THE FIELD BY THE PROJECT ENGINEER AS
REQUIRED BY ROADWAY CONDITIONS. 991-995 W MAIN RD
PROPOSED TEMPORAR - TEMPORARY TRAFFIC BARRELS _
‘ - - J— = ey :
B e ] aij%ig:ff’;ﬁsﬁ_’[” RIDOT APPROVED PUBLIC HEALTH AND SAFETY AND CONVENIENCE NOTES! MIDDLETOWN, RI 02842
SET IN CONCRETE ‘ 1. CONTRACTOR SHALL OBSERVE AND COMPLY WITH ALL FEDERAL, STATE, AND LOCAL LAWS
BLOCKS ALONG | REQUIRED FOR THE PROTECTION OF PUBLIC HEALTH, SAFETY AND ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY.
PROPERTY LINE | (NEWPORT COUNTY)
- - - 2. THE CONTRACTOR AT HIS/HER EXPENSE, SHALL KEEP THE PROJECT AREA AND SURROUNDING
3 WIDE TRAVEL AISLE 11" WIDE TRAVEL AISLE AREA FREE FROM RUBBISH, DUST, NOISE, EROSION, ETC. THE WORK SHALL BE DONE IN SHEET TITLE
. CONFORMANCE WITH THE AIR AND WATER POLLUTION CONTROL STANDARDS AND
- ! REGULATIONS OF ALL APPLICABLE FEDERAL, STATE AND LOCAL AGENCIES.
g n
— 3. NO CONTRACTOR SHALL PERFORM ANY CONSTRUCTION OPERATION SO AS TO CAUSE FALLING
= ROCKS, SILT OR DEBRIS IN ANY FORM TO FALL, SLIDE OR FLOW ONTO ADJOINING PROPERTIES, MAINTENANCE OF
i | STREETS OR NATURAL WATERCOURSES. SHOULD SUCH VIOLATIONS OCCUR, THE CONTRACTOR
e 1 MAY BE CITED AND THE CONTRACTOR SHALL IMMEDIATELY MAKE ALL REMEDIAL ACTIONS AS TRAFFIC PLAN
& /" EXISTING MEDIAN NECESSARY.
| ¥ 4 4. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE, INSTALL AND MAINTAIN ALL NECESSARY SIGNS, LIGHTS,
EXISTING { FLARES, BARRICADES, MARKERS, CONES AND OTHER PROTECTIVE FACILITIES AND SHALL TAKE
7 SIDEWALK ALL NECESSARY PRECAUTIONS FOR THE PROTECTION, CONVENIENCE AND SAFETY OF THE SHEET MANAGEMENT
T : P4 PUBLIC. PROJECT NO.: MIDDLETOWN R
' T =t 5. TEMPORARY LANE CLOSURES SHALL ONLY BE PERMITTED BETWEEN THE HOURS OF 9:00 AM DATE: -
| THROUGH 3:00 PM MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY. CRITERIA: 110' TUNNEL
EXISTING CURBING PROJECT MANAGER: N
6. NO WORK SHALL BE PERFORMED ON ANY FEDERAL HOLIDAY. ALL FRIDAY DAYTIME WORK ON —
—— TRAVEL LANE STRIPING ANY HOLIDAY WEEKEND MUST END BY 1 PM.
REPRODUCTION OR ALTERATION OF THIS DOCUMENT WITHOUT THE EXPRESSED WRITTEN
PERMISSION OF SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. IS PROHIBITED.
(NOT PUBLISHED: ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.)
COPYRIGHT BY SEVAN MULTI-SITE SOLUTIONS, INC. 2022
CROSS SECTION OF NORTHBOUND W SHEET NUWBER
CG o 1 0




	Sheets and Views
	G0.01 COVER SHEET
	plot

	G0.02 GENERAL NOTES
	plot

	G0.ALTA ALTA
	Plot

	C1.10 DEMOLITION SITE PLAN
	Plot

	C1.11 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL SITE PLAM
	Plot

	C1.20 DIMENSION CONTROL SITE PLAN
	Plot

	C1.30 GRADING SITE PLAN
	Plot

	C1.31 STORM WATER MANAGEMENT PLAN
	Plot

	C1.32 SAND FILTER AND CDS DETAILS
	Plot

	C1.40 UTILITY PLAN
	Plot

	C5.00 EROSION CONTROL DETAILS
	Plot

	C5.01 SITE DETAILS
	Plot

	C5.02 SITE DETAILS
	Plot

	C5.03 UTILITY DETAILS
	Plot

	C6.10 MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC PLAN
	Plot



